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Open for me the gates of righteousness; 

I will enter and give thanks to the Lord. 

Psalm 118:19 



In Spirit and in Truth: Stanzas on Worship 

- 1 -

Sunday morning sunlight; 
Soft organ tones; 
I sit, three seats back, silently waiting. 
Here in this palace sanctuary 
It is easy to forget You were born in a stable 
And wore a crown of thorns. 

Sometimes so easily distracted . . . 
Sour notes or faulty grammar; 

(Is the lectern scarf an inch too far to 
the left?) 

Likewise lulled 
By form and habit, beauty, decorum, 

(Spare us mere entertainment.) 

- 3 -

Lord, 
Help us not mistake: 

Candles, 
Flowers, 
Storied glass, 
Organ cadence, 
Mellifluous phrases, 

(This titillation of the senses) 
For the Shechinah glory. 
Beauty is not enough. 

Come 
With tongues of fire, 
Mighty wind, or 
Still small voice. 

Pour out your Spirit: 
Shake us. 

Lest we go away salved only; 
Uncured, 
Unchanged, 
Unchallenged, 
Empty. 

Having met each other. 
—But not You. 

—Pauline Stevick 

A member of the Lancaster, Pa., congregation, Pauline serves on the 
faculty of Messiah College. 
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in tijis issue. 

Three Brethren in Christ writers ad-
dress the intertwining themes of preach-
ing, ordination and spiritual leadership 
in the first section of this Visitor. A few 
pages later, early church leader Barna-
bas grants an "interview." And the edi-
torial calls all Christians to see them-
selves as ministers, not just preachers, 
missionaries or church planters—a truth 
reinforced by the back-page article, 
"Waste of Time." 

You won't want to miss the regular 
features, plus an "emergency warning" 
which arrived in our office on a compu-
ter print-out. And for those of you who 
want a glimpse into the future, a trio of 
articles on healing is scheduled for the 
March issue. 

In keeping with the spirit of the edi-
torial, we take this opportunity to rec-
ognize some people who help to make 
the Visitor possible, but whose names 
do not appear on the masthead each 
issue. 

Donna Soliday is secretary to the edi-
tor, edits church news, and is in charge 
of circulation. Weston Phipps heads up 
the art and composition department, 
and did the illustrations on the cover 
and pages 5, 6, 9, 12 and 32. He was 
recently named production coordinator 
for the printing division. 

Other employees and their major 
assignments are: Douglas Cassel (press-
room), Glenwyn Cassel (art department, 
mailing), Landon Charles (pressroom), 
Ruth Clouse (typesetting), Gilbert Go-
mez (proofreading), LeRoy Helmuth 
(pressroom), Tom Shumaker (bindery), 
DeVon Weaver (bindery), Patricia Wea-
ver (photo department, mailing), Don 
Weesner (photo department), and Viola 
Welty (bindery, mailing). 

Office and bookkeeping staff are: 
Phyllis Lentz, Glenda Sheets, and Paul-
ine Slabaugh. Jon Stepp is manager of 
the printing division and Elwyn Hock 
(general manager of Christian Light 
Bookstores) is executive director for the 
Publication Board. 

The list is not complete without a 
mention of the managers and staff of the 
eleven Christian Light Bookstores, since 
the stores help to underwrite the editor-
ial and production costs of the Visitor. 

It's a great team! 
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A Biblical Mandate 
by Rodger McCann 

Preaching is one of the more noteable 
parts of a worship service, certainly one 
which most people could readily iden-
tify with worship. But in spite of its pop-
ularity in the past and recognition as a 
part of worship today, we often find 
preaching under attack by some and 
simply neglected by others, or relegated 
to unimportance. We need to under-
stand some basic biblical as well as prac-
tical truths about preaching before we 
determine its importance and role in 
worship today. 

First, perhaps it would be best to 
answer the question, "What is preach-
ing?" Is it as Webster's New Interna-
tional Dictionary says, "to discourse 
publicly on a religious subject"? If that 
were so, then a sermon could be preach-
ed by anyone, in any setting, without 
there ever being any reference to God, 
the Bible, or God's saving action in 
Jesus Christ. It could well be man's 
thoughts or opinions about God rather 
than the truth of God as presented in his 
Word. 

If we are to consider preaching as 
God's Word to humanity, then it must 
follow that the Bible itself becomes the 
preacher's charter. Preaching only oc-
curs when the preacher becomes a con-
temporary instrument through which 
the prophets, apostles, and Christ him-
self speak. When God, who spoke for 
himself as recorded in the pages of 
Scripture, is allowed to speak again 
through preaching of the Bible, then an 
address truly becomes a sermon. 

"And the Word was made flesh, and 
dwelt among us."1 God gave his Word 

Rev. Rodger McCann has pastored the 
DeRossett and McMinnville congregations 
in Tennessee. Tentative plans are for him to 
begin a new church-planting project in Ten-
nessee this summer. 

to man, first in written and spoken form, 
then as the incarnate Son of God. As the 
writer of the book of Hebrews said, 
"God, who at sundry times and in divers 
manners spake in times past to the 
fathers by the prophets, hath in these 
last days spoken unto us by his Son, 
whom he hath appointed heir of all 
things, by whom also he made the 
worlds."2 The challenge we face in 
preaching is to make that Living Word 
live in the hearts of our hearers as we 
speak of his wondrous grace. 

If we are to fully grasp the meaning of 
what preaching really is, then it is impor-
tant that we have a reason for doing so. 
Why do we preach? What is the biblical 
mandate for preaching? Why should it 
be a consuming fire in the breast of those 
whom God has so called? 

Preaching is literally the "power of 
God." In his infinite wisdom, God has 
chosen preaching as the means of reveal-
ing to a lost world his power and pur-
poses. Individuals, in all of their conceit 
and supposed wisdom, may scoff at 
preaching, but it is God's ordained 
method of speaking to humanity. 

The presupposition behind all wor-
ship is a revelation. That is, that God by 
his very nature wants to reveal himself 
to mankind. God has "in due times 
manifested his Word through preach-
ing."3 If God has made himself known 
by the means of preaching, then preach-
ing is a very worthwhile task indeed. 

Preaching in the way God intended is 
not just a form of worship to be endured 
or a ritual to perform. True preaching 
must have the goal of persuasion. The 
more enthusiastically involved we are in 
any project, the more effort we will put 
into it. If we realize the "terror of the 
Lord,"4 then we must and will do all that 
is within our power to persuade people 
to turn from a life of emptiness to a life 
of fulness in Jesus Christ. 

God has charged us who are called to 

the gospel ministry "to feed the church 
of God."5 If we love God and love his 
flock, then we must responsibly feed the 
flock from God's Word. It is still true 
today that "man cannot live by bread 
alone," and we must see to it that our 
materialistically minded world gets food 
for the soul from God's Word. 

Why do we preach? Why not some-
one else, someone better suited or better 
qualified? Why me? First, because it is 
the call of God. No man can properly 
choose the task of preaching, but rather 
it chooses him. As God called Aaron, so 
he calls those today whom he will.6 And 
we preach because the whole of Chris-
tianity involves obedience to God. One 
cannot truthfully call himself a Chris-
tian unless there is a willingness to obey 
God. As the Apostle Paul said, "woe is 
unto me, if I preach not the gospel!" 

If we then begin to understand what 
preaching really is and why we preach 
the gospel, then we must consider what 
we are to preach. Never let us be like 
Ahimaaz who was eager to run, but had 
no tidings when he arrived, but rather be 
like Cushi who arrived with a message of 
truth, with compassion.7 There is a sense 
in which preaching calls the church into 
being. Preaching becomes a "spearhead" 
in the unifying of a congregation. With 
the background of a week of ministry to 
his people and sensitivity to their needs, 
the preacher bears witness by his sermon 
to how the gospel works in the lives of 
believers. 

Our message, though broad in scope, 
varied in style, and tailored to the needs 
of our people, should always be centered 
in "Jesus Christ and Him crucified."8 

We must teach our people that through 
the death of Christ, all the answers to 
life's problems and heartaches can be 
found. 

"The mystery . . . which is Christ in 
you, the hope of glory"9 must be pro-
claimed over and over to our congrega-
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tions. We must open up the mystery of 
ages and generations so that the world 
may know the wonder and goodness of 
God's grace. To fully understand the 
love of God for us through Christ is to 
change a person's life forevermore. If we 
could but grasp this truth of God and 
pass it on to those in our charge, we 
would do more to enhance true worship 
and devotion to God than any other 
plan or method known to man. 

Our people are varied, their needs are 
varied, and thus our message must be a 
variety of God's Word. Just as eating 
only one food, regardless of quantity, 
would soon lead to physical illness, so 
our spiritual diet must be balanced as 
well. Fortunately there is no problem, 
for God's Word is a veritable treasure-
house for those who would open the 
door. There we find words of instruction 
for those who lack knowledge, correc-
tion for those who have wandered from 
the path of righteousness, reproof for 
those who need reproving, doctrine that 
we may understand God's will—and all 
of these that we may live pleasing to 
God, that we may be worthy of our 
calling and thoroughly furnished unto 
all of God's work here on earth.10 

"But we have this treasure in earthen 
vessels."11 Thus we must carefully con-
sider how we are to preach this eternal 
truth of God. Since the days of the 
reformers our worship has been Word-
centered; thus the reading and expound-
ing of Scripture becomes more pro-
nounced. However, we must take care 
never to allow the sermon to achieve 
such a prominence that there is no 
response required of the hearers. If that 
happened, worship would become a 
mere listening activity, another "specta-
tor sport." The preacher then would 

become the center of the congregation's 
focus. His personality and prowess 
would be exaggerated beyond anything 
else and the concept of the church as a 
community of God's people responding 
to the preached Word would be lost. 
The congregation must be allowed, in 
fact, encouraged, to make a corporate 
response. 

Seeking to accomplish this, we must 
first be careful not to preach with wis-
dom which we have (or think we have), 
but rather let it be God's wisdom coming 
through. We must be careful not to set 
forth ourself, but be hidden behind the 
cross of Jesus. We must use care never to 
deceive our listeners, for the end never 
does justify the means.12 

We must also endeavor to preach all 
the council of God and not just a few of 
our "pet" ideas, doctrines, or philoso-
phies. In doing so we more thoroughly 
prepare our congregation to live as 
God's people.13 If it is God's Word we 
preach and not our own, we may preach 
boldly and without excuse or intimida-
tion.14 

One mistake often made is that of 
preaching above our listeners. Certainly 
the concepts and doctrines of God are 
high and lofty ideas, but they must be 
given in such a way that the least edu-
cated, least equipped of our congrega-
tion may grasp them easily. Plain speech 
may not be in fashion, but it is impera-
tive that our message be understood by 
our audience as much as our ability 
allows.15 

We must use care to "rightly divide 
the word of truth."16 There are many 
today who use Scripture to prove what-
ever they desire through manipulation 
and an incorrect understanding of the 
division of God's truth. Faithfulness at 

this point at times will require every 
ounce of the gifts that God has given us. 
But then, that's why God gave us gifts, 
to enable us to carry out his work.17 

Above all else, we must realize that it 
is not enough to preach one "sermon" a 
year while the rest are mere discourses. 
We must realize the burden of men's and 
women's souls are laid upon us and be 
faithful in all ways and at all times, as 
God is our helper.18 

In conclusion, if we are faithful to 
preach God's Word, then we should 
expect results. The results may be many 
and varied, not always what and when 
we expected, but they will come as we 
are faithful. People will be saved as 
God's message is preached by God's 
messengers and in God's way. Chris-
tians will be instructed in the way of 
Christian living. There will be evidence 
of holy living where God's Word gets 
through to hearts. There will be a re-
sponse of faith from those who learn of 
God's faithfulness through the ages. 
God will be glorified in our communities 
as his truth is proclaimed and as lives are 
changed. The body of Jesus Christ here 
upon earth will be edified and built up 
through the results of the faithful preach-
ing of God's Word. 

' John 1:14 
2Hebrews 1:1, 2 
'Titus 1:3 
*2 Corinthians 5:11 
5 Acts 20:28 
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I 

by David L. Hall 

Ordination seems to be one of those 
things in the church which is practiced 
without many people understanding 
either its background or purpose. More-
over, the meaning varies according to 
different church traditions. To illustrate, 
let me tell you about two churches I've 
been affiliated with, and their attitudes 
toward ordination. 

In one church, the pastor would not 
use the word "Reverend" in connection 
with his name, even though he had been 
ordained, because he thought it created 
an unnecessary and ill-founded distinc-
tion between himself and the people. At 
his insistence, the church people called 
him by his first name. In the other 
church, there were people who expected 
the benediction to be performed by an 
ordained man only, and in a certain 
way—with arms outstretched in bless-
ing. This was because the ordained per-
son alone, in their eyes, had the position 
before God to do such a thing as dismiss 
the congregation with God's blessing. 

Is ordination a matter to be relegated 
to the level of personal choice and opin-
ion? Of course, opinion isn't always the 
worst criterion. Plato said, "Between 
knowledge of what really exists and 
ignorance of what does not exist lies the 
domain of opinion. It is more obscure 
than knowledge, but clearer than ignor-
ance." On the other hand, opinion can 
have marginal value. I read one maxim 
which said, "Everyone has the right to 
his own opinion. It's generally no use to 
anyone else." So before we resign our-
selves to opinion, let's ask the question, 
what do the Scriptures say? 

Ordination is usually performed by a 
"laying on of hands," which in the Bible 
conveys several meanings. In the Old 
Testament, the person offering a sacri-
fice would lay hands on the victim. In 
the case of the scapegoat, there was a 
transfer of guilt.1 More often, the act 
was a way of setting the victim apart for 
a sacred purpose.2 The laying on of 
hands could mean blessing, as illus-
trated in the story of Jacob and Joseph's 
sons.3 And when Moses passed on to 
Joshua the task of leading Israel, the 
laying on of hands denotes the idea of 
ordination.4 

These ideas are carried into the New 
Testament. The laying on of hands can 

Looking 
at the 
conceptof 
RDINATION" 

An ordained minister and a graduate of 
Gordon Conwell Theological Seminary, 
David Hall is associate pastor of the Gran-
tham, Pa., Brethren in Christ Church. 

be for blessing, such as Jesus and the 
little children.5 Healing is often the 
focus, as in the ministry of Ananias to 
Paul6 and in many of Jesus' encounters.7 

In the book of Acts, the laying on of 
hands is a sign of ordination for the 
seven deacons8 as well as for Paul and 
Barnabas as they set out from Antioch 
on their missionary journey.9 And in the 
Pastoral Epistles, the laying on of hands 
is used in the context of imparting spir-
itual gifts to people being ordained.10 

We notice, too, the functions for 
which people were ordained, general 
concepts of ministry implied in such 
phrases as "ministry of the word," "min-
istry of the Spirit," "minister of right-
eousness," and "minister of reconcilia-
tion." In addition, there were the specific 
offices of apostle, prophet, evangelist, 
pastor/teacher, deacon and later the 
office of bishop. But there does not seem 
to be a great chasm between clergy and 
laity in the apostolic age. The ministers 
are as dependent on redeeming grace as 
the members of the congregation, while 
congregational members shared equally 
in the blessings of the gospel. There was 
equal access to the throne of grace and 
all had direct communion with Christ. 
The New Testament calls all believers 
"saints" and "priests." In I Peter the term 
for ministerial order does not denote 
some special group, but the believing 
community.11 

A distinct change came in the second 
century. The idea of a special priest-
hood, distinct from the people, had deep 

roots in both Judaism and the pagan 
religions. And while the church had set 
its course away from legalistic and cere-
monial observations (especially because 
of Paul's writings), the old pattern began 
to reappear after the apostles were dead. 
Some parallel can be found between the 
Levitical priesthood with its high priest, 
priest, and Levite and the developing 
idea in second century Christendom of 
bishop, elder, and deacon. The concepts 
involved with ministry became isolated 
and the term "clergy" changed in its 
focus, from all Christians ministering 
and serving, to a select group of people 
set apart for such tasks. Solemn ordina-
tion by a laying on of hands was the 
admission into this select group. And 
with the exaltation of clergy there was a 
separation from the common people. 
The clergy had special restrictions such 
as refraining from all secular business 
and a developing pressure for celibacy. 
And by the fourth century, there were 
official clerical costumes to further illus-
trate the separation of clergy and laity. 

This should be seen within the con-
text of other institutionalization within 
the church. Church life and personal 
expressions of faith were becoming in-
creasingly liturgical. Worship centered 
in the Eucharist and the set-apart clergy 
were the ones who could legitimately 
distribute the bread and cup to the peo-
ple. The parallel in the Old Testament 
priesthood is perhaps most obvious 
here. A contrast is also obvious with the 
first century church. In the apostolic 
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church, preaching and teaching were 
not confined to a particular class, but 
every convert could proclaim the gospel 
and many Christians with gifts would 
pray, teach, and exhort in the congrega-
tion. 

By the middle of the fourth century, 
ordination was a sacrament, a solemn 
consecration to the special priesthood, 
as baptism was the introduction of a 

contended that the Roman sacrament of 
ordination had a built-in separation of 
clergy/laity that led to tyrrany. Luther 
found no ground in Scripture for vows 
of poverty and chastity like those taken 
be monks and nuns. He urged people to 
avoid such things because of the non-
biblical support and because they bred 
pride and contempt for ordinary Chris-
tian living. He maintained that the 
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believer into the universal priesthood. 
Ordination was the medium for com-
municating gifts for the ministerial of-
fice, giving the capacity and authority to 
administer the sacraments and govern 
the body of believers in order to secure 
church order. Like baptism, ordination 
was a once-for-all endowment and could 
only be suspended in case of gross 
immorality or heresy. Thus, it became 
something important for its own sake; 
so much so that Augustine held that 
ordination was independent of the mor-
al and spiritual condition of the person 
ordained. The efficacy of the sacraments 
(notice the priest/mediation assump-
tion) did not depend on the devout state 
of mind of the priest. Instead, the whole 
church was understood as acting through 
him representatively. Thus ordination 
was very much a part of the growing 
formality that characterized the Catholic 
Church. 

When we come to the Reformation, 
ordination was one of many practices 
which received criticism, especially be-
cause it had achieved the status of a 
sacrament. Luther held that ordination 
had been invented by the Church of 
Rome. He admitted that as a rite prac-
ticed for many ages, it was not to be 
condemned, but he reiterated as basic 
convictions that all Christians are priests, 
that what is called priesthood is merely a 
ministry entrusted to those who exercise 
it with the consent of other Christians, 
and that ordination is a ceremony for 
choosing preachers in the Church. He 

works of priests and members of reli-
gious orders are no more sacred in the 
sight of God than those of a farmer in his 
fields or a woman in her household 
duties. 

Ordination among the sixteenth cen-
tury Anabaptists was not uniform. Organ-
ization and discipline differed between 
the Anabaptists of southern and north-
ern Europe. In the north, authority usu-
ally resided in a small circle of elders. 
These alone could baptize and effect the 
Son. In the south, authority lay more 
with the brotherhood as a whole. 

The terms "elder" and "bishop" were 
often used interchangeably in early Men-
nonite writing. It is noteworthy that 
many of the Anabaptist ministers who 
were formerly Catholic priests felt it 
necessary not only to be rebaptized, but 
to be reordained as well. The implica-
tion here is that ordination was under-
stood in different terms, and its resulting 
authority had a different focus. 

Within the Brethren in Christ church, 
there seems to have always been a con-
signment to ordained people those tasks 
traditionally thought to be ministerial 
duties such as preaching, baptizing, and 
administering the Lord's Supper. 

But unlike what had developed in the 
Catholic Church, we have a history 
where until as recently as the first half of 
this century, special measures were taken 
to minimize separation of clergy and 
laity. There were no stipulated salaries 
paid for ministerial services. There were 
often several pastor/teachers within a 

congregation who provided for their 
own finances through a secular voca-
tion. The 1935 Manual of Doctrine and 
Government, revealing a period of tran-
sition, says the pastor may either have 
congregational support or provide his 
own, both being acceptable scripturally. 

Over the years there seems to be no 
consistent policy regarding who is to be 
ordained. Ordination in the Brethren in 
Christ Church has been for bishops, 
ministers, and deacons. Sometimes the 
ministers' wives are ordained: other 
times they are consecrated. The 1935 
manual describes dedication for mis-
sionaries and children, but later policy 
allowed—or even called for—ordina-
tion for missionaries, especially men. 

Our current manual gives a rather 
explicit insight into the nature of ordina-
tion as it now stands within the church: 

Ordination is a rite having lifelong 
significance, and the ordained min-
ister carries the privileges and re-
sponsibilities of ordination through-
out life, conditional upon worthy 
conduct and loyalty to God and 
the church. 
Manual of Doctrine and Govern-
ment Article LIV, p. 122 

Having considered these brief obser-
vations regarding ordination from a bib-
lical and historical perspective, I want to 
conclude with some practical thoughts. 
What does ordination mean? What 
should ordination not do? 

I admit that I'm reading my own sub-
jective feelings into the data, so maybe I 
should say, what does ordination mean 
to me? My starting point in Ephesians 4 
where we read that Christ, as the head of 
the church, has provided "some to be 
apostles, some to be prophets, some to 
be evangelists, and some to be pastors 
and teachers . . ." When a person feels 
within himself or herself a call to a spe-
cial ministry of this nature, and (this 
"and" is very important) when the 
church recognizes and confirms this call 
to be valid, it is legitimate to set the 
person apart for that work. Ordination 
is that "setting apart." It is a recognition 
by the church of a person's gifts and call 
and then giving that person a commis-
sion to do the job. 

One might ask, "Well, if the person 
has the gifts and the church recognizes 
it, why a special commission and title?" 
One reason is to keep an established line 
of leadership and authority. But in say-
ing that, we who are ordained should 
remember that it means greater respon-

continued on next page 
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continued from previous page 
sibility. Notice these words from James 
and Peter: 

"Not many of you should presume 
to be teachers, my brothers, be-
cause you know that we who teach 
will be judged more strictly. "i2 

"To the elders... Be shepherds of 
God's flock that is under your 
care, serving as overseers—not 
because you must, but because 
you are willing, as God wants you 
to be; not greedy for money, but 
eager to serve; not lording it over 
those entrusted to you, but being 
examples to the flock.",3 

Finally, some things that ordination 
does not mean. Again, based on Ephe-
sians 4 and also I Corinthians 12, ordain-
ed persons do not have all the gifts, nor 
are they to do all the work. Notice in 
Ephesians 4:12 why pastors/teachers 
are given to the church: "to prepare 
God's people for works of service." In 
fact, that's what a good part of church 
gathering is all about. First of all, we 
gather to worship. But we also gather in 
order to learn how to minister to one 
another and to an unbelieving world. 
Worship and service always go together 
(look at Romans 12:1 very carefully). 
It's the pastor/ teacher who is "ordained" 
to see that this is being done. 

There is one other thing ordination 
does not mean. It does not mean that 
there is a double standard of righteous-
ness and holy living. The believer in the 
pew is called to holiness no less—and no 
more—than the preacher behind the 
pulpit. Ordination does not give the pas-
tor any mystical or magical resource to 
overcome sin and live victoriously. Our 
children aren't born sanctified, and 
weeds grow in our gardens, too. We 
have to live in the power of the Holy 
Spirit just the same way any believer in 
any place has to do. 

"Ordained" or not, may each one of 
us be built up in the faith and be com-
mitted to do our work of service in the 
church. 

References 
•Leviticus 16:21 
2Leviticus 24:14 
3Genesis 48:14 
"Numbers 27:18, 23; Deuteronomy 34:9 
5 Matthew 19:15 
6Acts 9:12, 17 
'Mark 5:23; 6:5; 16:18; and others 
8Acts 6:6 
9 Acts 13:3 
">1 Timothy 4:14; 2 Timothy 1:6 
"1 Peter 2:5, 9; 5:3 
12James 3:1 
I31 Peter 5:la, 2, 3 

by John A. Byers 

A 
From time to time people ask why 

Brethren in Christ Churches don't have 
a Board of Elders. There is a feeling 
among some that a church cannot expe-
rience its fullest power unless it uses this 
concept of leadership which they see in 
the Bible. 

Often these persons suggest that the 
reason people find the church to be 
lukewarm or tasteless is because they are 
faced with a church spoiled by man. 
They believe the cause of this spoilage is 
a less than biblical form of church 
structure. 

The solution, they suggest, for such 
lukewarmness is for a church to be led 
by elders to whom the local fellowship 
of believers are accountable. These 
elders are Spirit-chosen and confirmed 
by the congregation. They are responsi-
ble for the pastor (who is one of them), 
the church board, deacons and trustees. 
Therefore, the key to spiritual power, 
they conclude, is in having elders. 

It is noteworthy that the Brethren in 
Christ did at one time have elders. I 
remember when my father got mail 
addressed to Elder John Byers. Research 
of General Conference Minutes gives 
some insight into the view of elders in 
the Brethren in Christ Church. In 1883 
the General Conference was asked "May 
all ministers of a district solemnize mar-
riage. . . ." The answer was that only 
bishops should do so, not elders. In 
1885, General Conference was faced 
with the situation of inter-faith mar-
riages. This time Conference said it was 
the duty of all elders, ministers and dea-
cons to carefully instruct unmarried 
members on this matter. 

The Evangelical Visitor (September 
4, 1911) contains an article entitled 
"Elder or Bishop." The unidentified 
author says, "The term elder or bishop 

lders in 
designates the same office (Acts 20:17, 
18). The former refers to the man and 
the latter to the function of office." Tra-
dition tells us that later, "elder" was used 
as an alternate term for "Reverend." 

Should the Brethren in Christ return 
to the practice of using the term elder to 
designate the function of a particular 
person in the organizational life of the 
church? Perhaps it would be easier to 
answer that question if we understand 
the meaning and usage of the word. Kit-
tel's Theological Dictionary of the New 
Testament says that elder refers to one 
of an older generation as compared to a 
younger generation. It is one who has 
the positive element of venerability. 

In Sparta, an elder was someone with 
a political position, such as the president 
of an institution. Elder meant an office. 
The Greeks, however, did not use elder 
to identify an office-bearer but a group 
of older people. This set up the continu-
ing tension between elder denoting of-
fice or age. 

The Old Testament reveals a variety 
of usages of the term as well. Prior to the 
leadership of Moses, elders served as the 
representatives of the tribes and clans. 
They were the ones to speak for the 
family they represented. Under Moses, 
they were his colleagues. They accom-
panied Moses to visit Pharaoh, and they 
announced the coming exodus from 
Egypt. 

Numbers 11 reports their official ap-
pointment, but they did not have govern-
ing powers. It was during the time of the 
judges and the monarchy that the elders 
assumed governing privileges. It was the 
elders who confronted Samuel with the 
demand for a king (I Samuel 8:4). When 
Absalom threatened to take David's 
throne, David sent his priests to ask the 
elders to help him regain his throne (II 
Samuel 19:11). 

The collapse of the tribes during the 
post-exilic period did not bring an end 
to the role of the elders. During the exile 
they served as community heads, and 
worked with Jeremiah and Ezekiel. How-
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the local church 
The city gate was 
the meeting place 

for the elders 
in Israel. 

ever, as the period came to a close, the 
elders lost their place of prominence. 
The book of Nehemiah recounts one 
story of a leadership struggle between 
the elders and the nobles. 

Bridging the gap between the Old 
Testament and the early church is the 
Sanhedrin and the Hellenistic Jews. At 
first, an elder in the Sanhedrin was any 
member. Gradually, usage changed so 
that the term described a lay person as 
distinct from those in the priesthood. 
The Hellenistic Jews used the word elder 
to refer to members of the supreme 
court, Jewish senate and local authori-
ties. As we come to the early church, 
there remains the tension between the 
idea of the word elder designating an 
office based on a legal concept and the 
idea of elder being a person with spiri-
tual insight and authority. 

Well, you say, what was the practice 
of the early church? In Acts we find 
elders carrying the collection to Antioch 
(Acts 11:30), attending the Jerusalem 

Council (15:2,4,6) and representing the 
Jerusalem church when Paul visited 
(21:18). It may be significant that in Acts 
21:18, only the apostles and elders are 
mentioned and not the "ecclessia," or 
the larger assembly. 

Can Paul help us? First, we note that 
Paul rarely conferred a title on the 
office-bearer in a local church. It was his 
usual custom to refer to them in terms of 
their function, such as prophet, teacher, 
preacher, etc. (Compare Romans 12:7f, 
I Corinthians 12:28 and I Thessalonians 
5:12). In Titus 1:5, Paul says to appoint 
elders, but two verses later, in 1:7, he 
gives the portrait of a bishop. A number 
of scholars feel that the terms "episco-
pos" (bishop) and "presbuteros" (elder) 
are synonymous in the New Testament. 
Perhaps the different terms suggest dif-
ference in function, for in the Pastoral 
Epistles, the word bishop is always used 
in the singular, while the concept of 
elder is used in the plural and is seen 
referring to a group which ministers. 

So, what can we conclude? For one 
thing, it is very difficult to argue that the 
New Testament teaches one specific 
pattern of organization. In fact, in the 
New Testament, the early church was 
still so much an organism that it was 
only beginning to learn how to structure 
its life. That is not to say that when a 
church has structure it is an organiza-
tion and not an organism. But no society 
can live without some measure of order. 
Christ organized the 5,000 and the 4,000 
into groups of 50's and 100's. It is inter-
esting to note that the later books of the 
New Testament refer to office bearers 
(For example, see James 5:14). 

It has already been noted that the 
New Testament is not consistent in its 
use of the term elder. In I Timothy 5:1 it 
is clearly a designation of age. I Timothy 
4:14 uses it as an office of leadership, 
while in Titus 1:5, elders are appointed 
for the sake of order. Several factors are 
responsible for this. One is because the 
various congregations were in different 
stages of growth. Another reason is that 
the same term carried different mean-
ings for Jew and Greek. 

The principle of servanthood is in all 
of the passages. The tasks of preaching, 
feeding, teaching, etc. are not positions 
of status but opportunities for service. 
Also, the work of the church is not a 
"one man operation." There is no place 
for the person who wants to "lord it over 
others." Yet, there is a need for someone 
to give leadership. The important fact is 
not the terms we use but the principles 
we practice. 

What is biblical is that leadership is 
done in the plural. A church board can 
fill that role as well as a board of elders. 
One needs to be careful that in seeking in 
our organization to be biblical, we don't 
become so dogmatic in terminology that 
we kill the principle we wish to express. 

John A. Byers is bishop of the Atlantic 
Regional Conference of the Brethren in 
Christ Church. 
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Brethren—take note! A copy of the 
September 1982 Visitor containing 
Roger Sider's story, "On What It Is 
Like To Have More Money Than 
You Know What To Do With," has 
fallen into unfriendly hands. 

As a result, the enemy has placed 
his staff on "red alert" and issued 
the following memo, spearheading 

an assault on any person exhibiting 
stewardship, gratefulness or 
charity. 

Attired in three-piece suits (or 
Gloria Vanderbilt jeans, depending 
on your gender), his representatives 
will be calling on you, launching an 

all-out campaign to rid the world of 
biblical conscience and lifestyle. 
These foes are armed with blinders 
and are dangerous. Take heed, and 
read on. 

r»r—-5S5SS 
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by Ruth Brunk Stoltzfus 

Degrees : i u » t i m «uzH*k am 
How does one sort out her thoughts 

about academic degrees? 
My husband's and my degrees were 

all in his name except for my M.A. 
degree, meaning Ma, mother of five. But 
neither of us paid much attention to 
degrees. I once said to Grant, "People 
ask what degrees you have and I don't 
know what to tell them." So he told me 
and I wrote them down so I would not 
forget. 

Years ago, in a cozy mother-in-law/ 
daughter-in-law conversation, his moth-
er told me that while Grant was growing 
up he showed more interest in books 
and papers than in farming. So she and 
his father helped him to go to college 
even though, at the time, his father was 
the deacon in a congregation that preach-
ed against higher education. I love them 
yet for what they did. 

Grant slowly added more degrees 
along the way while he was a husband, 
father, editor, author, college and semi-
nary teacher, and active church layman. 
He had an insatiable appetite for learn-
ing but I never knew before that some-
one with four degrees would so much 
value the views of others whether they 
had degrees or not. 

Degrees? I guess I love them. 
But wait. Sometimes they cause an air 

of superiority, an eliteness that destroys 
biblical freedom and equality in the 
Chris t ian b r o t h e r / s i s t e r h o o d , the 
church. If they are not counted as loss 
for Christ's sake, they hinder the use of 
others' gifts. Sometimes they seem to 
foster competition more than caring, the 
spirit of ruling more than serving. In the 
selection of leaders and workers, degrees 
are sometimes considered more impor-
tant than spiritual qualifications or en-

Ruth Brunk Stoltzfus, Harrisonburg, Va., 
enjoys a family "tribe" of 16, including seven 
grandchildren. As founder and manager of 
Concord Associates she produces family life 
messages for newspapers and radio and 
sometimes travels for speaking engagements. 
She manages some rental units "owned by 
the bank and me." 
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dowment of gifts or dedication to God 
or continuing years of self-directed 
study. 

Degrees are thought to make people 
authorities, even in areas they have not 
studied. A church committee was plan-
ning special meetings on family life rela-
tionships. One committee member 
(male) with a newly acquired doctor's 
degree in church history was asked for 
ideas with "bowing and scraping" by the 
chairman. Another member of the com-
mittee (female), who for 19 years had 
studied, written and spoken on family 

Sunday, Feb. 13 • Psalms 21-23 
Monday, Feb. 14 • Exodus 38-40 
Tuesday, Feb. 15 • Leviticus 1-3 
Wednesday, Feb. 16 • Leviticus 4-6 
Thursday, Feb. 17 • Leviticus 7-9 
Friday, Feb. 18 • Leviticus 10-12 
Saturday, Feb. 19 • Leviticus 13-15 
Sunday, Feb. 20 • Psalms 24-26 
Monday, Feb. 21 • Leviticus 16-18 
Tuesday, Feb. 22 • Leviticus 19-21 
Wednesday, Feb. 23 • Leviticus22-24 
Thursday, Feb. 24 • Leviticus 25-27 
Friday, Feb. 25 • Numbers 1-3 
Saturday, Feb. 26 • Numbers 4-6 

life relationships, was not asked for 
ideas. 

In a large Sunday school class of men 
and women, a critical world situation 
was being discussed. A medical doctor 
spoke up who may have known more 
about the bones of the body than world 
affairs, yet a hush fell over the entire 
group. A medical doctor was speaking! 
In that congregation there are people 
with doctors' degrees in different fields 
and with higher education than a medi-
cal degree, but a medical doctor is 
addressed as "Doctor" and not "Broth-
er" as are the other kinds of doctors. 

Perhaps a ten-year-old girl expressed 
the typical reservation about those other 
doctors when she answered the phone 
one day. The caller asked if the child's 
father was a medical doctor since "Dr." 
was in front of his name in the phone 
book. "O, no," the girl said, "he's not the 
kind of doctor who can do anybody any 
good." 

Degrees? I guess I love them or hate 
them depending on whether they are 
used as tools under the lordship of 
Christ or worshipped as idols under the 
lordship of Self. 

Sunday, Feb. 27 • Psalms 27-29 
Monday, Feb. 28 • Numbers 7-9 
Tuesday, Mar. 1 • Numbers 10-12 
Wednesday, Mar. 2 • Numbers 13-15 
Thursday, Mar. 3 • Numbers 16-18 
Friday, Mar. 4 • Numbers 19-21 
Saturday, Mar. 5 • Numbers 22-24 
Sunday, Mar. 6 • Psalms 30-32 
Monday, Mar. 7 • Numbers 25-27 
Tuesday, Mar. 8 • Numbers 28-30 
Wednesday,Mar. 9 • Numbers31-33 
Thursday, Mar. 10 • Numbers34-36 
Friday, Mar. 11 • Deuteronomy 1-3 
Saturday, Mar. 12 • Deuteronomy4-6 

11 

Used by permission of the National Association of Evangelicals, Box 28, Wheaton, IL 60187. 



njissions 
Barnabas, well-known leader in 

the early church, "talks" with Arlene 
Miller, Secretary of Home 
Ministries for Brethren 
in Christ Missions. 

outside of Palestine, the synagogue, 
rather than the temple, became the cen-
ter of our religious and social life. Of 
course, there were no sacrifices in the 
synagogue as in the temple. 
How did you view the Jerusalem 
Temple? 

Of course Jerusalem was the center of 
Judaism and communication flowed 
back and forth between Cyprus and 
Jerusalem. We would make periodic 
journeys to Jerusalem for the feasts, 
especially the Passover. There we partic-
ipated in the temple sacrifices as part of 

An 
interview 

with the feasts.^jfi But for many of us who 

Barnabas 
-the "One Who 
Encourages" 

lived away from 
Jerusalem, the 
temple did not 

hold the same deep sig-
nificance as it did for 

native Palestinian Jews. 
Another element was the cultural dif-

Barnabas, your name, which means 
"one who encourages," was given to you 
by the apostles, wasn't it? Why did they 
prefer that to your name Joseph? 

Well, I often seemed to find myself in 
situations where I was helping to build 
relationships between individuals and 
groups within the developing church. 
How did God prepare you for this role? 

I was born and raised in Cyprus. My 
family were Levites and assisted with the 
care of the synagogue and teaching in 
the services. For those of us who lived 

This is the third in a series of articles relat-
ing to ministries by the Brethren in Christ in 
North America. Thefirst two articles appear-
ed in the Oct. 10 and Nov. 25 issues. 

ferences between the native Palestinian 
Jews and those of us who were scattered 
throughout the Roman Empire. In addi-
tion to learning the language of the peo-
ple around us, we took on some of the 
culture. Of course, we were still dis-
tinctly Jewish in relation to the Gentiles 
around us. But we were often very dif-
ferent from our Jewish brethren who 
had always lived in Palestine. 
What languages do you speak? 

I speak both Aramaic and Greek. 
During my earliest years on Cyprus I 
was most comfortable in Greek. 
Did you live in Jerusalem for some time? 

Yes, the family of my Aunt Mary, 
John Mark's mother, lived in Jerusalem 
for many years. I came to the city several 
years before the death and resurrection 
of our Lord. 
Barnabas, how did your background 
prepare you to be "one who encourages" 
in the developing church? 

Well, one of the earliest hurdles we 
faced after Pentecost involved a misun-
derstanding between two cultural groups, 
the native Palestinian believers and the 
Greek-speaking immigrants. Having 
come from outside Palestine, I could 
identify with the concerns of the immi-
grant group. At the same time, my posi-
tion as a Levite and my having lived in 
Jerusalem for some time helped me to 
gain the respect of the church leaders, all 
of whom were native Palestinians. 
Could you say more about what hap-
pened? 

Of course. The days following Pente-
cost were glorious and turbulent. Our 
leaders in Jerusalem were the apostles, 
all native Palestinians. They were used 
mightily of God to teach the rapidly 
increasing numbers of believers. 

We shared our goods and food, and 
fellowshipped together in our homes. I 
had a field in Cyprus which I sold and 
contributed the proceeds to the com-
mon fund for those in need. Others were 
doing the same. These funds were dis-
tributed by the apostles. 

The problem arose because the Greek-
speaking believers saw that their widows 
were being neglected in this distribution 
of funds. 
How did you solve the problem? Per-
haps the Greek-speaking widows were 
being overly sensitive. 

You have asked two questions. I will 
answer the second one first. The prob-
lem was not that the widows were being 
overly sensitive, so much as that the 
apostles were being unwittingly insensi-
tive. Let me explain. Because the apos-
tles were native Palestinians, communi-
cation flowed to and from them within 
the larger native-born Palestinian com-
munity through language and cultural 
and family ties. There was no leader-
ship, however, representing the com-
munity of Greek-speaking believers. The 
differences in language and culture made 
communication more difficult. In the 
case of the widows, they often did not 
receive word concerning the fund distri-
bution until it was too late. Thus, they 
really were being neglected, not because 
of intent, but because of poor communi-
cation. 
Well, it would seem to be a simple mat-
ter to select someone to take the word to 
them. 

It was a bigger issue than merely 
transmitting information. These people 
were concerned that someone in a posi-
tion of power would be looking after 
their interests. The Holy Spirit used this 
development to lead us to a major 
breakthrough in our understanding of 
leadership in the church. 
How was the matter handled? 

I, with several of my fellow Cypriots, 
went to the apostles with the concerns of 
the widows and the larger Greek-speak-
ing community. I helped them to see 
that this was a serious matter which 
needed a creative solution. 

Following that, the apostles called the 
entire group of believers together and 
asked us to choose seven men who were 
full of the Holy Spirit to care for the 
distribution of funds to those in need. 
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This pleased everyone and seven men 
were selected. Six of them were immi-
grant believers and the seventh was a 
Gentile convert from Antioch. For the 
first time, major leadership responsibili-
ties were entrusted to Jewish believers 
who were not native Palestinian Jews. 
Did this harm the witness of the church 
among the larger Jerusalem community? 

In the words of Brother Luke, "And 
so the word of God continued to spread. 
The number of disciples in Jerusalem 
grew larger and larger, and a great 
number of priests accepted the faith" 
(Acts 6:7). 
I thought the gospel would have broken 
down those cultural differences. 

Well, very slowly we began to see that 
God accepted persons from every cul-
tural group equally. I could tell you 
many stories of how long and painful 
those lessons were, but Brother Luke 
has written many of them in his letter to 
Theophilus. 

At the same time we began to see also 
that our cultural differences were valua-
ble in helping us to grasp a fuller mean-
ing of the gospel. For example, those of 
us who did not view the Temple in the 
same way as the apostles did were better 
able to grasp the idea that Gentiles, who 
were not permitted in the Temple, would 
be accepted by God. We needed each 
other to stretch beyond our own some-
times narrow understanding. 

Thus, it was not so much that cultural 
differences were obliterated, but rather 
that they were valued and respected. It 
was later in Antioch that we saw in 
another way the significance of prepar-
ing leaders for the church from every 
cultural group. 
What about Antioch? 

During the days when Saul was per-
secuting the believers, many fled to cities 
scattered throughout the Roman Em-
pire. As you know from Luke's account, 
the believers preached the Good News 
of Jesus wherever they went, but to Jews 
only. However, then came Peter's expe-
rience with Cornelius; the apostles real-
ized that the Good News was for the 
Gentiles as well. Some of my fellow 
Cypriots, along with men from Cyrene 
in North Africa, went deliberately to 
Gentiles in Antioch. The Lord's power 
was with them and a great number of 
Gentiles believed and turned to the 
Lord. 
That really confirmed what the apostles 
had recognized earlier about the Gen-
tiles, didn't it? 

Yes, but it was also quite radical. The 
word spread quickly back to Jerusalem. 

One or two God-fearers like Cornelius 
was one thing, but great numbers of 
Gentiles were another matter. At least 
God-fearers were people who had some 
knowledge of Judaism and the Scrip-
tures. But these were untaught people. It 
was agreed that someone from Jerusa-
lem would need to investigate this new 
development. 
Did Peter go? 

No, it was felt that because of my 
background as a Greek-speaking Jew 
from Cyprus I would be better able to 
relate to both my fellow Cypriot evange-
lists and the Gentile believers they had 
led to the Lord. 

When I arrived at Antioch, I imme-
diately sensed the hand of God in what 
had occurred. The Lord used me to bless 
my fellow Cypriots and the new Gentile 
believers. The Lord also empowered me 
through his Spirit and even more people 
came to the Lord. 
I remember reading that you went to 
Tarsus to get Saul to help you. Why did 
you select him? 

I remembered Saul from the days 
fourteen years earlier when I had sup-
ported him in his efforts to establish 
communication with the Jerusalem 
church. Of course they were fearful of 
him, even three years after his conver-
sion, because they had suffered much at 
his hand. I saw then how deep his under-
standing of the gospel was and had 
heard since of his continuing ministry in 
Tarsus. Saul was a Roman citizen and 
spoke Greek, Aramaic and Latin 
fluently. 
What was your ministry with Saul? 

We taught for one year. We were par-
ticularly interested in working with po-
tential leaders in the growing church at 
Antioch. We focused on three men: 
Simeon, Lucius and Manaen. 
Manean is the only Jewish name you 
have given. Was he Jewish? 

Yes, he was raised in the court of 
Herod in Galilee. Simeon was called the 
Black and was from Africa. Lucius was 
a Greek from Cyrene. Because the group 
of believers at Antioch included all of 
these cultures, it was important that the 
leadership of the group reflected that 
same diversity. 
I notice that you and Saul are listed as 
leaders along with these three by Luke. 
What is the significance of that? 

We shared the power equally with 
these men. We knew that for them to 
carry the responsibility they were given 
in teaching and preaching, they needed 
to be given real authority. Thus, we 
shared the decision-making of the group 

The following principles from the 
interview with Barnabas will be deve-
loped in the next article relating to 
home ministries in the Brethren in 
Christ Church: 

1. A church which binds persons of 
diverse cultures in brotherhood re-
flects greater dimensions of God's 
image. 

2. When people of differing cultu-
ral heritage live as neighbors, poten-
tial conflict always exists. 

3. Persons gifted and prepared for 
cross-cultural communication facili-
tate brotherhood among diverse cul-
tural groups. 

4. The developing of church leaders 
from each cultural group must be 
intentional. 

5. Leadership of the church at every 
level must reflect the cultural diver-
sity of its membership. 

Watch for this article in the May 
Evangelical Visitor. 

with them mutually. Later, we together 
agreed that the Holy Spirit was sending 
Saul and me on to an itinerant mission. 
I am surprized you moved them so 
quickly into these responsible positions. 
Today we usually require persons to 
move up through the system. 

Well, for one thing, it is the Holy 
Spirit who gives the gifts of teaching and 
preaching which need to be developed. 
These men were recognized leaders who 
had gained the respect of their people. 
Furthermore, if we had required that 
they work through the same system as 
the Jerusalem church leaders, they 
would never have qualified. 

You might also be helped if you knew 
that these three did have an opportunity 
to work without Saul and me while we 
took the relief collection to Jerusalem. It 
was following our return from that mis-
sion that the Holy Spirit spoke to the 
five of us as we were worshipping the 
Lord and fasting one day. We all agreed 
that he was telling Saul and me to leave 
on a preaching mission. What a blessing 
it was for Saul and me to have these men 
we had discipled lay their hands on us 
and commission us for further service. 

References 

The Book of Acts. 
A World of Difference: Following Christ 
Beyond Your Cultural Walls, by Thorn 
Hopler. (Downers Grove, IL: InterVarsity 
Press, 1981). 
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About a year ago we asked if we could 
have a short study experience during 
this furlough. Now so quickly it is 
history. 

We agree with the person who said 
the biggest problem in attending Fuller 
School of World Mission is digesting 
the abundance. Maybe you have had a 
similar feeling at the family Christmas 
feast—so many things to taste and all so 
good! We are still digesting and assimi-
lating the "goodies" from the fall quarter 
at Fuller. We would like to share with 
you some of the infill and our reactions. 

Culture and Language 
Thinking it would help us to encour-

age young recruits on our mission field, 
we signed up for the "Culture and Lan-
guage Acquisition" class. From the start 
we were impressed with the different 
approach but sensed we may be putting 
our vulnerability on the line. 

The lesson on cultural bonding spelled 
out what had been part of our job for the 
past fifteen years: meeting the new mis-
sionaries at the airport, helping them 
through immigration and customs, 
coddling and protecting them for the 
first few days of jet lag and culture shock 
and then gently landing them at their 
post without too much jolt. For the first 
week or so the "stranger" was surround-
ed and reinforced by many homeland 
artifacts. Finally, the recruit got to "the 
people" and hoped there would be ac-
ceptance and ministry. 

But this course taught that for a new-
comer to become a belonger, he or she 
should be met at the port of entry by a 
national and be entertained straightway 
by the host culture for the first month or 
so, to take advantage of the absorption 
which happens during early exposure 
when the learning "adrenalin level" is 
high. 

Furlough 
feasting 
by Pete and Mim Stern 

Upon returning from class one night, 
a phone call from Roy Sider in London 
brought a message from the recent 
Zambian church Executive Board meet-
ing. It was proposed that Zambians be 
the ones to orient new missionaries, 
beginning in 1983. What a coincidence 
that two similar inputs came in the same 
week. 

Meanwhile, it was proposed that we 
move to the Copperbelt for a church-
planting ministry—into a new area and 
language group. Although the original 
thrust was for the many Batonga people 
living in that area, the ministry must be 
to all people, regardless of tribe. Per-
haps the course in language and culture 
was meant more for us than for those we 
would encourage. 

Church planting in the Copperbelt 
will mean not only a change of place but 
of pace. As we wait for the Lord's spe-
cific direction, we are aware that God 
may be wanting to do a new thing. 
Paradoxically, part of the new thing 
may be not even returning to Zambia, 
due to Pete's heart problem. He is hav-
ing further studies these next months. 
We are trying to "hang loose." 

Church Planting 
A course in "Techniques of Planting 

New Churches" involved surveys and 
studies pointing up some interesting 
facts and ideas: 

—A primary reason for people not 
going to church is boring sermons. 

—Unchurched people want need-ori-
ented sermons. 

—Church growth happens best when 
a good pastor stays long enough for 
something to happen. 

—Failure comes not so much in fail-
ing to reach a goal, but in failing to set a 
goal. People do not set goals for fear of 
failure. God wants us to set goals on the 

basis of what he is, not what we are. 
"You haven't believed God until you 
have attempted something that cannot 
be done in the flesh" (Rick Warren). 

—An enthusiast knew about a soon-
to-be-developed new ethnic community 
and planted a church there, all ready to 
receive the newcomers in their vulner-
ability. 

—Missionaries are expected to plant 
churches among ethnic groups overseas. 
Today America has the world at her 
doorstep with so many ethnic groups 
pouring in all around us. Are we accept-
ing the challenge of the nations at our 
door? 

Prayer 
The class in "Foundations for Spiri-

tual Life: Prayer" warmed and stimu-
lated us as we read, studied, discussed 
and had small group sharing on the sub-
ject. During term, a classmate died of 
cancer of the liver, which made very 
practical the lesson on "What about 
when we pray and God doesn't answer 
the way we ask?' 

Pertinent to us as missionaries was 
the thought that workers' effectiveness 
in the harvest field is in direct relation to 
the prayers for those workers by God's 
people. There are many instances of 
those burdened enough to pray becom-
ing the "goers." Are people willing to 
agonize in prayer, to fast, so that the lost 
will be saved? 

We can be rich in theory and methods 
about doing God's work. But unless all 
we do is bathed in prayer, unless we 
know how to get hold of God and allow 
the Holy Spirit to be released through us 
and through those with whom we work, 
little lasting good will be realized. We 
were both grateful for this class as we 
sensed a personal deepening in our spir-
itual lives. 

With this sampler we conclude by 
asking that you "hang in there" with us 
in prayer (as you have done before) as 
we wait for positive health signs, all the 
while becoming more malleable and 
conformable to his will and purpose. • 

Pete and Mim Stern have served as mis-
sionaries in Africa since 1952. While in 
North America, they are available for speak-
ing appointments with groups and congrega-
tions. For more information, contact Esther 
Ebersole at the Brethren in Christ Missions 
office, P.O. Box 27, Mount Joy, PA 17552-
0027; (717) 653-8067. 
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MCC Players tour North America 

Acting Out the Message 
Four and a half months on the road, 

traveling thousands of miles, giving up 
to ten performances a week in different 
churches, eating at a different table 
every day, and waking up in a different 
room every morning may seem like a 
strange way to live. But for the MCC 
Players, it represents only part of their 
rigorous and adventuresome schedule. 

Through drama, reader's theatre, 
song, and pantomime, the group focuses 
primarily on the Mennonite Central 
Committee's 60-year history and on var-
ious aspects of the peace issue. While 
touring North America, the six young 
actors are conveying the news and views 
of MCC to Mennonite and Brethren in 
Christ churches wherever they perform. 
As one of the actors says, they are 
"planting seeds in the minds of the peo-
ple, challenging them to think and to 
act." 

Two of the Players, Jeff Books and 
Nick Frey, are members of the Brethren 
in Christ Church and graduates of Mes-
siah College. Jeff is the son of Virgil and 
Nadine Books of Waynesboro, Pa., 
while Nick is the son of Charles and 
Anne Frey of Conestoga, Pa. 

The idea for the troupe originated 
through Mark Beach of the MCC Infor-
mation Services office in Akron, Pa. 
and came to life when Jeff Books be-
came director in early 1982. 

Although the idea of using drama to 
present the MCC story is relatively new 
in Mennonite and Brethren in Christ 
circles, and although the audiences have 
often been small, the response has been 
positive. The Players notice that mod-
ern audiences ask questions about the 
actors themselves, but despite this curi-
osity have given them a "gracious recep-
tion." One of the six, Kathleen Hull, was 
pleasantly surprised when people ap-
plauded, a taboo in her Baptist back-
ground. However, she feels that au-
dience feedback is essential because 
theatre is two-way communication. 

In order to give the audiences an 
"involved sense" of the nature of MCC, 
the troupe's presentations combine fac-
tual events with the personal experien-
ces of workers. The Players are "message-
oriented in an artistic way," one reason 
for their acceptance. Their flexibility in 
stage arrangement and compactness of 
props necessitate an artistically simple 
production. A down-to-earth approach 

makes people feel comfortable, allowing 
the message to dominate. 

Programs for churches start with an 
historical sketch of MCC. The dramas 
touch on themes of relief, development, 
justice, and on actual fictional situations 
dealing with draft registration and Chris-
tian lifestyle. A less requested option 
from their three hour repertoire is a 
medley of selections that are more enter-
taining than thought provoking. 

For Sunday morning services the 
presentation is more conventional, com-
posed of litanies, songs, children's sto-
ries, and a major dramatic devotional. 
Dialogue with the congregation is encour-
aged at the end since one of their pur-
poses is to provide communication be-
tween constituency and MCC. 

The actors report that sometimes the 
powerful message of the five to six short 
dramas called "A Cry for Peace" almost 
overwhelms the observer. According to 
Hull, the troupe hopes that the topics 
and dilemmas presented will result in 
reflection that will continue after the 
presentation. "It's not the initial response 
that is so important. We want to com-
municate that MCC is really there, 
working overseas in small communities, 
trying to help the best the volunteers 
can. The volunteers face a lot of larger 
questions about culture, relief, and 
development." 

As in any voluntary service, the Play-

Kathleen Hull and Gary Hasek on stage. 

ers have to cope with difficulties. Trans-
cience, lack of solitude, frustration with 
the simplicity of the performances—are 
all dealt with as the members support 
each other through personal relations 
and Bible study. Bringing life to these 
dramas day after day requires discipline 
and sacrifice. But despite occasional 
doubts, one member's purpose often 
seems so clear that she can say with 
conviction, "Hey! I know why I'm here." 

In January the Players visited church-
es from Florida to Virginia before mak-
ing their long trip to the western United 
States and then back through the Mid-
west. Their last performance is sched-
uled for May 1, 1983 at the Manor 
Brethren in Christ Church in Cones-
toga, Pa. Since that is his home congre-
gation, for Player Nick Frey that should 
prove to be a happy and long-awaited 
homecoming. 

From MCC news releases by Anita 
Tiessen and Joy Hoffer. 

MISSIONS SUNDAY -MARCH 20 
"Not by might, nor by power, 

but by my spirit" 
M a r c h 20, 1983, has been des igna ted "Miss ions S u n d a y " 

t h r o u g h o u t t h e B r e t h r e n in C h r i s t C h u r c h . C o n g r e g a t i o n s a r e 
e n c o u r a g e d t o plan a service f o r th is day e m p h a s i z i n g t h e mis -
sions m a n d a t e of t he c h u r c h . A p r e s e n t a t i o n on t he Biblical 
basis f o r miss ions is s u g g e s t e d . If M a r c h 20 is n o t sui table , 
a n o t h e r S u n d a y d u r i n g Len t is s u g g e s t e d as an a l t e rna t ive 
miss ions e m p h a s i s day. 

R e s o u r c e mater ia l s in t h e f o r m of a pos te r , bul let in in se r t s 
and Bible r ead ing gu ides a re be ing mailed to c o n g r e g a t i o n s in 
F e b r u a r y . For m o r e i n f o r m a t i o n o r ma te r i a l s f o r y o u r Miss ions 
S u n d a y service, con tac t Louis Cobe r , Sec re t a ry f o r C h u r c h 
Rela t ions , B r e t h r e n in C h r i s t Miss ions , P .O . Box 27, M o u n t 
Joy, PA 17552-0027; (717) 653-8067 . 
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The 
First 
Eight 

Months 
by Dora Myers 

Excerpts from personal journal 
entries during her service 

with Brethren in Christ 
Missions in Japan. 

August 26, 1980, Tuesday, 12:30 a.m. 
My journey begins in the dark. At night, under the stars, above the waves, 
speeding through the air to Hawaii and on to Tokyo. . . . 

Oh, I think of my friends so special, so dear to me. I think of my family. 
I have so much, so many things to be thankful for. What a blessed woman! 
Lord, you have walked me through each day. Lord of my heart, of my life, 
thank you for your care each moment, for directing my path, for gifts of 
friends and family and, best of all, freedom in you. I rest myself in you 
tonight. 

August 27, 1980, Wednesday 
I feel tired and disoriented, but, thankfully, not discouraged in the least. It's 
very, very quiet out tonight. 

September 2, 1980 
This is our first night in the new apartment at Fuchu. The day has been 
busy packing up and moving, cleaning this filthy flat of rooms, and shop-
ping for those first groceries. Mary, Connie and I had a nice supper of 
grilled cheese sandwiches, grapes and McVities Digestives. Today has been 
a good day of working together. 

September 21, 1980, Sunday 
Friday finished my two-week sound pattern course in Japanese; very 
intense and lots of homework which I never felt I'd thoroughly prepared. 
Even though it was very demanding, I really enjoyed the learning and the 
sense of accomplishment of communicating in spite of the elementary 
level. Each day I can hear more, understand more. . . . 

Each day I speed by train past miles and miles of narrow, crooked streets, 
each lined with apartments, filled with people, millions of people. 

September 25, 1980, Thursday 
Didn't sleep very well last night. After the first earthquake about midnight 
I slept so very lightly and woke often. All totalled there were four. Nothing 
to do but lie there and take it. I thought of the green woods and pastures of 
Pennsylvania, the sunshine, my cat. . . . 

Yesterday I sat in on my first English class. The discussion was slow. I 
got awfully sleepy, struggled not to yawn. 

October 1, 1980 
Sometimes I feel as though I move about in a plastic bag, separated by a thin 
film of something from everyone. Once in a while, to my relief, this is pene-
trated. This morning, seated in the sun, waiting for my bus, the air cook, a 
short, bent man, sweeping up cigarette butts, came to me with a toothy smile 
and a "good morning." 

October 13, 1980 
Trusting the Lord is hard enough. I now struggle with trusting people 
with myself. So many times my self is hurt, is crushed by thoughtlessness. 
Naturally, I retreat. I build protective walls. Not many are consistently 
kind, dependably caring. I don't ask for these in excess. God, you wean me 
away from people onto yourself, into yourself again and again, over and 
over. "Bless the Lord who healeth thee, who redeemeth thy life, who 
crowneth thee with lovingkindness and tender mercies." 

November 15, 1980, Saturday 
There was a little beggar woman in the train station tonight. Father, there 
are many things about this life that I don't understand—the little woman, 
separation, etc.—sometimes I feel like being totally intemperate—to 
scream. Not now, but sometimes. 

November 21, 1980, Friday 
It's late. I hear the rain outside. This week has been busy with teaching and 
classes. . . . 

The Siders are here. Roy is such a tease! I thought I'd cry. It wasn't sad-
ness at all, but sort of a relief, an untying, a releasing, a peace at hearing 
English. I hadn't realized how much I've missed it. 

I 



I 

December 1, 1980, Monday 
I'm waiting for the bath to heat. It's dark outside; I'm alone. If I could just 
cry a little maybe, I'd feel so much better. There is so much to do. You've 
given me a work that I cannot possibly do alone. Father, your daughter is 
tired, she is sad, her heart feels heavy. Father, fill me with your grace. As we 
celebrate your light—the Light of the World—illuminate us. 

December 7, 1980, Sunday 
It's such a refreshment to my heart to sit among these people during the 
service. Sermon title was "My grace is sufficient—your strength is made 
perfect in my weakness." 

January 4, 1981 
Most intriguing this frozen winter afternoon were the last rays of sun 
angling over the mountains to shine on the underneath of each needle-
laden branch of pine. I've caught that image, frozen it in my mind. 

January 5, 1981, Monday 
Got a letter from Mary Sue today. I laughed and cried—good, strong emo-
tions, pure and wholesome response. 

January 18, 1981, Sunday 
Lord, this week is going to be so full. Be with me, help me to do my best in 
everything for your honor, for your glory. Give me wisdom to handle diffi-
cult situations, difficult questions. Help me to be satisfied with my best 
and go on to the future. 

February 17, 1981, Tuesday 
I met this day in a flurry of huge snowflakes as I stepped out for the paper. 
What a wonderful surprise! What a pleasure to feel those huge, wet flakes 
cling and melt on my neck. 

February 21, 1981, Saturday 
I'll never understand the love that allows me to approach, not neutral, not 
positive, but in great need and leave with everything. How can He love me 
this much? How can I love others that much? 

March 7, 1981, Saturday 
Oh, Dora. Another day past, more people met, more vocabulary taught. 

March 10, 1981 
Dear Lord, thank you for the day, for the flowers, plum blossoms, the 
smiles of friends, pictures sent by mail, the care I feel from those around 
me. Lord, I love you. 

March 15, 1981, Sunday 
Plum trees and some other shrubs are in full bloom, creating fragrances so 
vivid and pleasing that at times I can scarcely endure the smelling. Clear, 
starry night. Another week lies before me. 

March 11, 1981, Tuesday 
Lord, it's your way that I pray for, isn't it? It's your will that I want, don't 
I? Help me to see, to accept. I see so many hours of rebellion that get in my 
way. I want to live in the fullness of your will. As your daughter, work in 
me the grace and maturity and completeness of a holy woman, alive physi-
cally and emotionally and spiritually. 

March 31, 1981, Tuesday 
It's late. It's very late. Tonight I returned from a two-day trip with Connie 
to a lot of mail. Oh, sweet mail from special people, so dear to me. Read-
ing these few words brings tears of remembrance, silent chokes of longing, 
sighs of relief, prayers of gratitude. 

April 19, 1981, Sunday 
Day by day I walk on, meeting what is to meet. Lord, be with me. I need 
you. Sometimes I feel as if I 'm pouring out my life, not spilling. Spilling 
carries the connotation of accidental. I will this spending—of time, of this 
study, of this work. It is a willful pouring of energy. Living God, how 
much we owe you. 

•ntm 

Dora Myers taught 
English as a second 
language in Japan in 
1980-82. Recently married, 
she is living with her 
husband, Toru Kawate, in 
Japan. 
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Profoundly impacted by the revolution 

Nicaraguan church asks for understanding 
from North American evangelicals 

Ron Sider, who recently visited Nica-
ragua, reports that evangelical Chris-
tians there are "deeply disturbed by 
what they consider to be a highly dis-
torted picture of their country in the 
United States." Sider, evangelical auth-
or and lecturer whose trip was partially 
funded by Mennonite Central Commit-
tee Peace Section, toured Nicaragua 
with seven other North American evan-
gelical leaders. Their visit was at the 
invitation of the Evangelical Committee 
for Aid Development (CEPAD), which 
represents Protestants in Nicaragua. 

C E P A D had earlier protested to 

North American churches when reports 
surfaced that the United States had 
launched a massive campaign to desta-
bilize and eventually remove Nicara-
gua's Sandinista government. Newsweek 
(November 8, 1982) reported that the 
CIA provided funding for armed attacks 
in Nicaragua by former members of 
Somoza's National Guard. In a highly 
polarized situation the evangelical 
church in Nacaragua, which historically 
has had strong ties with North America, 
has had to struggle to find its identity. 

Sider reports that while "Nicaragua 
today is not a Utopia," most Nicara-

guans claim that life is much better than 
life under Somoza. Government priori-
ties under the Sandinistas have shifted 
from favoring a small wealthy minority 
to programs which "promote basic edu-
cation, health care and an adequate 
food supply for the majority who are 
very poor," Sider says. 

The church has been affected by 
society's new emphasis on aiding the 
poor. Thelma Pareira, who manages an 
evangelical radio station, says that evan-
gelicals in Nicaragua are now concerned 
"not just with the soul but with integral 
growth." Rodolfo Fonseca, a pentecos-
tal, confessed that formerly he was not 
concerned for hungry people and injus-
tice, but now the evangelicals have dis-
covered Luke 4:16 and want to trans-
form both the soul and the environment. 

Is there religious freedom in Nicara-
gua? Sider observes that virtually ev-
eryone the group spoke with reported 
complete freedom of religion. "Reve-
rend Joaquin Gato, a pastor in the pen-
tecostal Church of God, said he traveled 
all over the country and found full reli-
gious freedom everywhere. There is free-
dom to worship, to evangelize in public 
places and to distribute Christian litera-
ture freely. Even the U.S. ambassador 
flatly asserted that he had no fear that 
religious freedom would be threatened 
even in the long term." 

The director of the Bible Societies in 
Nicaragua, Ignacio Hernandez, spoke 
of the rapid increase in Bible distribu-
tion, some of it due to the government's 
successful literacy program. He reported 
that about 400,000 copies of the New 
Testament had been given to people 
who had just learned to read, and 
appealed for help to fund an additional 
400,000 that they want to distribute to 
other newly literate people. 

In spite of reports that the govern-
ment allows religious freedom and that 

A large poster of General Sandino, the 
national hero, appears in front of the 
entrance of the cathedral on the central 
square in Managua. The church strug-
gles in the new Nicaragua to find its 
identity. 
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the church is growing, Sider reports that 
tensions between the church and state 
during 1982 were troubling. 

A few evangelicals waged a highly-
visible campaign in May and June, 
declaring that the devastating spring 
floods were "God's judgment on atheis-
tic Nicaragua." A charismatic evangelist 
from the United States, Morris Cerullo, 
had pamphlets distributed which claim-
ed that satanic activity in Nicaragua was 
stronger than ever. When Cerullo arriv-
ed in Nicaragua on the day of General 
Sandino's birthday celebration, the govern-
ment refused to let him enter. 

During late summer, tensions between 
the state and church escalated and a 
number of churches were taken over by 
unauthorized local popular organiza-
tions, Sider relates. Hostile slogans were 
painted on churches and the govern-
ment newspaper, the Barricada, attack-
ed all evangelicals as "sects." 

CEP AD, which has good relations 
with the government, promptly protest-
ed the anti-church crackdown to the 
government. CEPAD also met with top 
government officials and demanded the 
return of church properties. Approxi-
mately 80 percent of evangelical groups, 
which claim to have 400,000 members in 
Nicaragua, participate in the work of 
CEPAD, which was established under 
the leadership of Dr. Gustavo Parajon 
immediately after the earthquake in 
1972. MCC, which has four workers in 
Nicaragua, also works directly with 
CEPAD. 

In spite of tensions between the 
church and state, Sider reports that 
"very few evangelical leaders seemed 
hostile to the government. At the same 
time I also sensed some uneasiness and 
fear on the part of a substantial number. 
Some worry about the presence of 
Cuban teachers, doctors, technicians 
and very probably military advisors." 

It is clear that the evangelical church 
in Nicaragua has been profoundly im-
pacted by the revolution. Sider says, 
"one of their strong feelings was a deep 
feeling of being neglected and ignored 
by their evangelical brothers and sisters 
in the United States. Church delegations 
from the World Council of Churches 
and the National Council of Churches, 
they said, had come much earlier to 
listen to them, but evangelicals had not. 
They do not in any way demand that 
U.S. evangelicals agree with them, but 
they very much want us to come and 
listen to their problems, concerns and 
viewpoints." 

MCC News Service • 

Growing the Small Church 
A Guide For Church Leaders 

By C. Wayne Zunkel 

Reviewed by R. Donald Shafer 

Every now and then you find a book 
that has a special ring of truth as you 
read it. You know it is real and that it 
will be helpful to others. Such was my 
experience as I read Wayne Zunkel's 
practical guidebook entitled, Growing 
the Small Church. It is a new book 
(1982), written out of the context in 
where most churches find themselves. 
As the writer reminds us, the average 
congregation in the United States has 
fewer than 200 members. Thus he writes 
to help pastors and local church leaders 
who really want to do something about 
growth. With the thrust of helping church-
es see the value of their smallness, the 
author goes on to deal with the reality of 
what happens to congregations that 
remain small. 

Having met the author, I knew that 
his writing would be honest and helpful. 
Here is an experienced pastor who has 
served local churches of varying sizes 
and at points east and west in the United 
States. He writes with humility and with 
a caring concern for those who live life 
in the arena of the average congregation. 

What is even more exciting about this 
book is that it is written by a man with 
roots in the Brethren church. That will 
be helpful to those of us who are 
Brethren in Christ. With church growth 
principles skillfully applied, the author 
deals with potential that can be based on 
faith worked through to productive 
action. From the bottom line of biblical 
natural growth, the reader is led through 

the crucial principles and strategies of 
church growth. Pastors will find the fifth 
chapter on "Leadership, Followership, 
and Growth" of special significance. 
And the workbook format with repro-
ducible overhead slides makes it a re-
source far beyond the average book on 
the market. 

The reader will find that issues are 
faced squarely and a variety of options 
for growth are shared in concept and 
practice. It is set forth in eleven chapters 
that can be shared as lessons with oth-
ers. Pastors and planning groups will 
find this book a refreshing drink from 
the well of church growth water. 

Bishop Don Shafer is the director of evan-
gelism and church growth for the Brethren in 
Christ Church. 

Published by David C. Cook for $14.95, 
Growing the Small Church may be ordered 
from Christian Light Bookstore, P. O. Box 
189, Nappanee, IN 46550. 
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Cumberland Valley 

This is the second in a series of articles featuring the 1982 
Sunday Schools of the Year. The Cumberland Valley 
Brethren in Christ Church (formerly Williams Grove) quali-
fied for the Sunday School of the Year award in both per-
centage and numerical increases in attendance. During 1981, 
they achieved a gain in average attendance of 29, which 
amounted to a 120% increase. 

by Ralph Roach 

Running and maintaining an effective Sunday school can 
be as frustrating as keeping track of leftovers in your refrig-
erator or freezer. I can state this from my experience of 
being responsible for the Cumberland Valley Brethren in 
Christ Sunday School and also working as the Inventory 
Control Supervisor in the Food Service Department at Mes-
siah College. However, the ingredients for a successful Sun-
day school are not completely elusive. At the Cumberland 
Valley Church we have both accidentally and purposefully 
discovered several of these important ingredients. Just as 
every good cook knows that there are indispensable addi-
tives to a good recipe, so there are essential elements to 
every successful Sunday school. Here are some ingredients 
that we have discovered and used. 

Learner centered 
First, a successful Sunday school program must be 

learner-centered. From the time our pastor Ray Bert and 
our congregational leaders anticipated moving into our 
newly-built church, we decided to extend love, acceptance, 
and forgiveness to all who would come through our church 
doors. Our primary concern has been to function as a trans-
forming community by loving, accepting, and forgiving in 
Jesus' name many guilt-ridden, burdened and hurting peo-
ple. Our emphasis is on ministering to individuals, not on 
building extensive programs or on teaching dogmatic doc-
trines. By placing individuals above any sincere desire to 
simply indoctrine people with "correct" teaching, we have 
created an atmosphere where Bible learning can occur in a 
non-threatening and affirming environment. 

When individuals sense that they are sincerely loved and 
cared for, then they are more likely to wrestle with and inte-
grate into their lives the transforming truths and principles 
from God's Word. The love of God and the life of Christ, 
incarnate in the lives of fellow Christians, Sunday school 
teachers and pastors, is able to reach out and transform the 
lives of people. 

We have also tried to design our Sunday school program 
so that it is effective in meeting the needs of our learners. 
Someone once said that "success is finding a need and filling 

Ralph Roach is the Director of Christian Education for the Cum-
berland Valley, Pa. congregation. 
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Ingredients 

Growt 

Enjoying a puppet show. 

it." Many of our teachers have built sincere and warm 
friendships with the learners under their care. Personal vis-
itation by Paul Lebo in the adult class contributed signifi-
cantly to the doubling of that class in one year. Many of our 
teachers combine a good meal with an invitation to "get 
acquainted," which usually produces a positive experience 
and helps to break the ice in establishing new friendships. A 
good Sunday school must be learner-centered! 

Flexible in methods 
I believe that another significant factor in the growth of 

our program and learner interest is our ability to be flexible 
in our teaching methods. In our adult classes we have not 
restricted ourselves to the "lecture only" approach to present-
ing and learning truths from the Word of God. We combine 
group discussion, small group inductive Bible study, visual 
aids such as overhead projectors, posters, and chalkboards 
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Sunday School: 

with a teacher lecture. We try to avoid redundancy and 
attempt to be creative in our communication of the Word of 
God. We owe this to our learners who take the time out of 
their busy lives to share with us in a Bible-learning expe-
rience. A good Sunday school program is one that is flexible 
in its teaching approach and methodology. 

We are fortunate to have a dedicated and enthusiastic 
team of Sunday school teachers. Did you catch the two key 
words? A successful Sunday school program cannot exist 
without people who are dedicated and enthusiastic! A nega-
tive attitude about the church, its leaders, other Christians, 
etc. on the part of a teacher can kill a class and threaten the 
rest of the program. We feel that if teachers cannot serve 
enthusiastically and with hearts filled with love, acceptance, 
and patience, then regardless of how knowledgeable and 
important they are, we do not allow them to teach until they 
have a change of heart. A good Sunday school program 
must have a staff of dedicated and enthusiastic people. 

Qualifications, Job Description, and 
Covenant for Teachers at Cumberland Valley 
Qualifications: 

Sunday school teachers must: 
1. be born-again believers. 
2. show a willingness to commit themselves to 

ministry, fellowship, and body life at the 
Cumberland Valley Church. 

3. have a desire to help others to grow in 
Christ and evidence a call to the teaching 
ministry. 

4. be mature, flexible, and able to get along 
with others. 

Job Description: 
Teachers are expected to: 

1. teach class regularly (allowing approxi-
mately four weeks of excused absences as a 
guideline). 

2. arrive at least 15 minutes before Sunday 
school begins. 

3. use the materials approved and provided by 
the church. 

4. be available to meet with the rest of the 
staff for regularly scheduled planning and 
training meetings and conferences. 

February, 1983 

5. be committed to visit the students at least 
twice a year and to follow up absentees 
(writing notes is also a good way to make 
and keep personal contacts). 

6. read Lawrence Richards' book, A Theology 
of Christian Education, and attend one 
conference a year which will enhance tea-
ching/ ministry skills. 

7. be willing to commit themselves to serious 
study of God's Word. 

8. be flexible in their approach to teaching, 
and be free in the Spirit. 

Covenant: 
I pledge to live according to the standards and 

expectations of Christian conduct as given in the 
New Testament, and commit myself to the goals 
and teacher job description as presented by our 
church, and dedicate my teaching ministry for the 
equipping and maturing of my fellow saints 
(learners). 

Signed, 9/13/82 
(one year term, 1982-83) 
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Teach for change . 
As a teaching staff our primary goal in — ^ ° teach 

for change We don't want change just for the sake ot 
change but we want people to become 
Christ If we cannot measure over a period of time steady 
andprogressive growth in our learners, then we cannot be 
L t f i e d S ouf teaching ministry, even though we might 
he successful in communicating Bible content. 

Change in our learners must occur in three areas if our 
t e a c S i s T o be effective. First, there must be a change in 

S i This is the transmission of facts, truths about 
and from the Word of God. Second, there must be a 
espons" o the new information b y t h e l e a r n e . tharef lc t s 

a change of attitude. Third, there should be a progressive 
L d consistent change in the learners' actions> that rrfl cU 
Christ-likeness. A successful Sunday school program teaches 
f n r c h a n a e in information, attitude and actions. 

I b e h e v e that the success of any Sunday school program is 
a l s o s gmf cantly related to its commitment to present Jesus 
C h r i a s Savior and Lord, and to uphold the Word of God 
as t h e final authority on matters of doctrine, faith and lifes-
t y l e At Cumberland Valley Church, we have h a d t w o e U 

ng and busy years. We hope our success will continue as we 
Pastor Ray Bert greets some of his parishioners. 

grow We are indeed grateful to our sister churches who 
have given us the important ingredients and support to 
make a successful Sunday school as realized dream. • 

Cumberland Valley Sunday School 
Goals for 1982-1983 

' fl Spiritual: As we are equipped through the 
W o r d of God, various gifts, and body 
ministry, we should be seeing the life ot 
Christ in each other, as well as clear evi-
dence of the fruit of the Spirit (Gal. 
5:22-26). , , , 

b Numerical: As we meet people s needs 
' and touch theirlives where they are hurt-

ing then healing and intimacy will occur 
as we minister and fellowship. Also, we 
will d raw others into this "caring 
communi ty ." . 

2 Fellowship: We are committed to developing 
' meaningful and caring-nurturing relation-

ships, especially with those who are weaker 
in addi t ion to teaching facts about the Bible 
or telling others of God's love and judgment . 

5. 

6. 

Unity: As a result of our study in God s 
Word , meeting real needs and developing 
meaningful relationships, we will grow in the 
unity of the Spirit which will help us individ-
ually and collectively to know God s will. 
We will bring the Christian education stall 
and teachers together regularly for lesson 
planning and staff meetings. 
We will join together before each service (9.00 
a.m. sharp) for prayer and a brief devotion. 
We will plan and implement an effective 
Christian Educat ion Seminar on October 15-
16 (1982) with the theme, "Helping Teachers 
to Equip." (This goal was achieved already, 
with Dr . George Kimber, Dr . J o h n Yeatts 
Rev Charles Pugh, and Ralph Roach partic-
ipating and leading the workshops.) 
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Waste of time 
from page 32 

I was ready to leave—had been for 
quite some time, in fact—but Jody 
pulled a booklet out of the witnessing 
packet we always carried with us. "This 
contains pretty much the same informa-
tion we've discussed tonight," she ex-
plained. "I hope you'll continue to attend 
services at our church." 

"Yes, I will," Betty promised, walking 
toward the door. 

"And why don't you come back to 
choir?" I suggested. "We have a new 
director now, and he's just excellent." 

"Maybe," Betty said. "It's not a very 
friendly group, though." 

I forced a smile. I had gone out of my 
way to be friendly to her! "Give us 
another chance." 

"Maybe," she repeated. "Good night." 
As far as I was concerned, the evening 

was totally wasted. By then it was too 
late to make another call, and Betty 
Harris was just plain unreceptive to the 
gospel. 

"That's a woman in real need," Jody 
told me as we drove back to the church. 
"We'll have to remember her in prayer, 
Kitty." 

"Yes, we will," I agreed, not meaning 
it. Oh, I'd pray for her, I decided, but 
people like Betty Harris seemed to enjoy 
their misery. I had known others like her 
in the past. Attempting to help them was 
usually a waste of time, and frustrating 
besides. 

At the church we had a report session, 
same as always, with some of the other 
teams sharing first-time decisions for 
Christ. That was typical each Monday 
night, but somehow Jody and I hadn't 
been as successful during our weeks 
together. 

I t's just not worth it," I told my hus-
band on the way home. "I'm having a 
terrible time learning the witnessing 
presentation and feel awkward giving it. 
I really don't think I'm going back." 

Kitty, you commited yourself for six-
teen weeks," Dave reminded me, "and 
we still have a few to go. I think you 
should stick it out." 

And so I did—reluctantly. I still was-

n't convinced that I belonged in the pro-
gram, though. There were other things I 
could have been doing on Monday 
nights. 

Not everyone is cut out for this type of 
witnessing after all, I announced to my 
reflection in the hall mirror. 

On Thursday night Dave and I had an 
early dinner and went to choir practice. 
At least there I felt sure of myself and on 
solid ground. Of course I had been a 
choir member for years and years and 
loved to sing. 

I was talking to someone—I don't 
remember who—and suddenly I stop-
ped and stared at a woman sitting alone 
on the other side of the room. It was 
Betty Harris! 

After the initial shock of seeing her 
there, I hurried over to say hello. "I'm so 
glad you came back!" I said. 

"Thank you," she replied, her voice 
and facial expression showing no enthu-
siasm at all. 

I refused to let her strange personality 
throw me, as it had in the past, imme-
diately introducing her to our new direc-
tor and some of my friends. Fortunately 
they seemed to overlook Betty's lack of 
warmth—or whatever it was—and show-
ered her with attention. 

I told Jody about Betty's return to 
choir and she was delighted, of course. 
"I'm sure it's because we visited her and 
you invited her to come," she said. "It's 
an answer to prayer, isn't it?' 

"Yes, I guess it is," I agreed, still not 
fully convinced that it was. Betty Harris 
was back in choir, yes, but so what? 

M uch to my surprise, she kept com-
ing and gradually began to warm up just 
a little. Eventually there was even some-
thing which could pass for a smile on her 
lips when she saw me. Well, that's an 
improvement, I had to admit. 

Last Sunday she grabbed me in the 
robe room and gave me a hug. "Kitty, I 
was hoping I'd see you this morning!" 
she hissed excitedly. 

"Betty, what is it?" I wanted to know, 
staring at her. The usual narrow, untrust-
ing eyes were wide open and beautiful. 
Her whole face was radiant, in fact. 

"I did it!" she whispered. 
"Did it?" I repeated, frowning. "What 

do you mean?" 
"I asked Jesus to be my Savior last 

night!" she explained, smiling. "I've been 
fighting it for so long—possibly because 
of a terrible experience I had at another 
church—but I was reading that little 
book you and the other lady gave me 

and suddenly everything made sense. I 
finally realized that I couldn't do it on 
my own, that I needed Him to save me! 
Kitty, I'm so happy!" 

She was happy? What about me? Me, 
who thought that the evening we had 
spent in Betty Harris' apartment had 
been wasted? Me, who had actually con-
sidered quitting the witnessing program 
because God didn't seem to be using me! 

I couldn't wait to tell Jody of course. 
For some reason she didn't seem at all 
surprised. "I expect miracles," she told 
me. "But I want you to do something, 
Kitty." 

"Keep in touch with Betty?" I sur-
mised. 

"Yes, of course—and we'll have to get 
her into a Bible study group, too, so she 
can grow spiritually, but I want you to 
tell the other visitation teams about 
Betty and what the Lord has done in her 
life." 

I would have preferred singing ten 
solos to giving one report in front of the 
witnessing class, but I was willing to 
share my experience, not only because it 
was such a beautiful story, but because I 
knew there were others in the program 
who had considered quitting, just as I 
had. 

"You may be thinking it's a waste of 
time," I said," but let me assure you that 
Satan wants you to think just that, and 
he'll throw as many roadblocks in your 
path as possible to keep you from com-
ing out each Monday night. I came 
awfully close to falling for his lies, but 
I'm glad I didn't." 

There was spontaneous applause from 
my friends in the class, and I blushed in 
spite of myself. 

"I do want to say one more thing," I 
added when the clapping stopped. "Bet-
ty's husband is not a Christian, but 
apparently he has seen a real change in 
her life already because he's coming to 
our choir banquet in a couple of weeks. 
I'd like to ask special prayer for him." 

I felt a lot different about witnessing 
and our witnessing program than I did 
not so long ago. Yes, it's very exciting if 
you have a first-time decision while 
you're in the home, but God doesn't 
always work that way. 

Sometimes we plant spiritual seeds, 
other times we water, and occasionally 
we're given the honor of harvesting a 
soul for His Kingdom. But the impor-
tant thing is that we go out and share our 
faith with those who don't know Jesus 
Christ. 

That is never a waste of time. Betty 
Harris is living proof. 
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church neiris 
Allegheny Conference 

Four choirs f rom the Carlisle congregation, 
involving over 100 people, presented a concert, 
"Sounds of Christmas" on Sunday, Dec. 19. The 
choirs were accompanied by instrumental groups 
f rom the church. • The Dillsburg congregation 
participated in a local Crusade for Christ on Dec. 
5-12. Churches in the Dillsburg area organized the 
crusade. 

Ten persons were recognized by the Mt. Rock 
congregation for perfect Sunday school attend-
ance for 1982. Paul Wenger, who has been attend-
ing the Mt. Rock Sunday School since 1905, 
received the attendance award. • Nineteen persons 
were received into membership by the New Guil-
ford congregation on Sunday, Dec. 12. 

On Sunday, Nov. 14, the Pleasant View congre-
gation held dedication for a ten-foot addition, 
carpet, pews, air conditioning, heating system, and 
a steeple. The steeple was erected in honor of the 
congregation's first pastoral couple. Rev. and 
Mrs. Samuel Lady. In addition to Rev. Lady, the 
current pastor, Harold Bowers; Bishops Charlie 
Byers and Alvin Book; Albert Engle; and Kenneth 
Sechrist also took part in the services. 

The first and second grades of the Waynesboro 
Sunday School held a contest to earn money for 
three missionary families. A total of $62.11 was 
given to purchase Christmas gifts for the Gilmores 
in Venezuela; the Spanglers in California; and the 
Witters in New Mexico. 

Atlantic Conference 
The College-Careers Class of the Cross Roads 

Church sponsored a Christmas dinner for the con-
gregation on Sunday, Dec. 12. • A New Year's Eve 
Service was hosted by the Elizabethtown congre-
gation. Congregations invited to participate in the 
joint service were: Conoy, Crossroads, Maytown, 
Mount Pleasant, and Shenks. The film "John 
Hus" was shown. 

The Holden Park congregation announces that 
three persons were received into membership on 
Sunday, Dec. 26. • An installation service was 
held by the Lancaster congregation for their new 
associate pastoral couple, Scott and Judy Miles. 

An "In-Gathering" victory dinner was held by 
the Souderton congregation on Sunday, Nov. 21, 
following the morning worship service. Over 
twelve thousand dollars was received. 

Canadian Conference 
Rev. Charles Byers was the guest speaker for 

spiritual growth meetings held by the Rosebank 
congregation on Nov. 17-21. 

Nine persons were received into fellowship by 
the Sherkston Church on Sunday, Dec. 12. The 
Ladies Auxiliary of the congregation provided 
Christmas gifts for children f rom Timber Bay 
Children's Home. • The Westheights congrega-
tion held an installation service recently for Dave 
Ward as student assistant pastor. 

Central Conference 
The Carland Zion congregation reports their 

teens sponsored a family night recently. The film 
"Humpty" was viewed after a hayride. 

A Sunday school contest held by the Dayton 
congregation f rom Oct. 4-Nov. 14, resulted in 91 
visitors. Sixteen of them are now regular attenders. 

An international Christmas program was held 
by the Music Department of the Fairview congre-
gation. • Church board members of the Pleasant 
Hill Church led members of the congregation in an 
evaluation meeting. Small groups were formed for 
discussion time. Organized activities were held for 
the children. 

The film, "God's Prison Gang," was viewed by 
the Western Hills congregation on Sunday eve-
ning, Dec. 5. 

Midwest Conference 
The choir of the Bethany congregation pre-

sented the cantata, "King of Love," on Sunday 
evening, Dec. 12. • Special guest of the Rosebank 
congregation on Wednesday, Dec. 29, was Roy 
Sider. 

The Zion Church made MCC grocery bags 
available to the congregation as a church/family 
project. The bags are to be filled with nutritional 
food for the hungry. 

Pacific Conference 
A holiday pot-luck dinner was enjoyed by 

members of the Diamond Bar congregation on 
Saturday, Dec. 11. The dinner was hosted by Lee 
and Diane Breitenbach. 

Guest speaker for the Labish congregation on 
Sunday, Jan. 2, was Rev. Art Cooper. • Bishop 
Don Shafer ministered to the Upland congrega-
tion on Sunday morning, Dec. 26. A Christmas 
communion service was held in the evening. 

For The Record 
Births 

Brubaker: Marcus Anthony, Nov. 16; Verle 
and Maralee (Hade) Brubaker, Carland Zion 
congregation. Mi. 

Burkholder: Curtis Mark, Nov. 23; Mark and 
Joyce Burkholder, Big Valley congregation, Pa. 

Fretz: Jacob William, Dec. 9; Terry and Wendy 
Fretz, Sherkston congregation, Ont. 

Gerlach: Gretchen Elaine, Dec. 7; Bruce and 
Margie Gerlach, Manor congregation, Pa. 

Glenney: Sarah Elesha Naomi, Nov. 22; Bob 
and Becky Glenney, Wainfleet congregation, Ont. 

Gose: Jonathan Michael, Oct. 31; Mike and 
Evelyn (Sisco) Gose, Bothell, Wa., formerly of the 
Carland Zion congregation, Mi. 

GrofT: Jonas Isaac, Dec. 21; Joseph and Ginger 
Groff, Elizabethtown congregation. Pa. 

Grove: Christopher Charles, Sept. 1; Jay and 
Peggy (Charles) Grove, Mt. Rock congregation, 
Pa. 

Henderson: Chad Tyler, Dec. 4; Vern and 
Mary Henderson, Wainfleet congregation, Ont. 

Homsher: Kari Ann, Dec. 1; Don and Kelly 
Homsher, Refton congregation, Pa. 

Kilts: Justin Wayne, Dec. 3; Wayne and Cindy 
Kilts, Wainfleet congregation, Ont. 

Leister: Brent Thomas, Nov. 29; Clifford and 
Linda Leister, Cedar Grove congregation, Pa. 

Miller: Christopher Michael, Nov. 19; Jay and 
Helen Miller, Cross Roads congregation, Pa. 

Musser: Aaron Daniel, Dec. 9; Merle and 
Kathy Musser, Upland congregation, Ca. 

Szusz: Ryan David, Dec. 9; David and Frieda 
Szusz, Rosebank congregation, Ont. 

Waller: Matthew Eric, Nov. 29; John and 
Peggy (Eshleman) Waller, Lancaster congrega-
tion, Pa. 

Weddings 
Curtis-Switzer: Edna M. Switzer and Wayne 

O. Curtis, both of Upland, Ca., Oct. 14, in the 
Upland Brethren in Christ Church with Rev. 
Robert Hempy officiating. 

Harner-Mumma: Heather, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Adin Mumma, Mt. Joy, Pa., and Jef-
frey, son of Mr. and Mrs. Robert Harner, Greens-
burg, Pa., July 25, in the Salem United Church of 
Christ, Campbelltown, with Rev. Barry Smock 
officiating. 

Knight-Sherk: Mae Sherk and Muriel Knight, 
Dec. 9, in the bride's home in Ontario with Rev. E. 
C. Flewelling officiating. 

Leckie-Steele: Leslie Steele and Wayne Leckie, 
Oct. 2, in the Emmanuel United Church, Ont., 
with Rev. Daniel Boone officiating. 

Murray-Madeira: Julie, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Madeira, Lancaster, Pa., and Paul B., 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Murray, Lockport, 
NY, Nov. 27, in the Lancaster, Pa., Brethren in 
Christ Church with Revs. Merle Brubaker and 
David Madeira officiating. 

Shearer-Harnish: Tami, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Abram Harnish, and Richard, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Shearer Jr., Oct. 23, in the 
Pequea, Pa., Brethren in Christ Church with Rev. 
Gerald Wingert officiating. 

Obituaries 
Casler: Frank E. Casler, born Dec. 3, 1895 near 

Brookfield, Mo., died Nov. 28, 1982 in the Vete-
rans Hospital, Des Moines, la. In May 1920, he 
married Sadie Lutz who survives. Also surviving 
are a daughter, Pauline; two grandchildren; and 
two great-grandchildren. He was preceded in 
death by a son, Leroy. He was a member of the 
Brethren in Christ Church. Rev. Millard Halde-
man conducted the funeral service in the Dallas 
Center Brethren in Christ Church. 

Swartz: Earl H. Swartz, McAlisterville, Pa., 
born March 27, 1907, died Oct. 20, 1982. He was 
the son of Cyrus and Ella Spade Swartz. He was 

continued on next page 
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Messiah College to launch 
overseas degree program in Kenya 

Daniel Houck Ordained 

Messiah College, located in Gran-
tham, Pa., is in the process of launching 
"Messiah College—Africa," a baccalau-
reate program based in Africa for the 
granting of Messiah bachelor of arts 
degrees. 

The program will be carried out in 
cooperation with Daystar Communica-
tions, an educational and research insti-
tution located in Nairobi, Kenya. Fall of 
1983 is the target date for beginning the 
program. 

A Christian school, Daystar presently 
offers a post-secondary diploma and an 
accredited master's degree in coopera-
tion with Wheaton Graduate School. 
Interestingly, it does not have a bacca-
laureate degree program. Messiah Col-
lege is stepping in to fill that need, said 
Dr. D. Ray Hostetter, president of 
Messiah. 

President Hostetter outlined several 
of the reasons for selecting Daystar 
Communications, a choice made after 
visiting a number of institutions in other 
countries. "Nairobi is an excellent loca-
tion because the city is an Afro-Asian 
crossroads in transportation, culture, 
and commerce. Daystar, as an institu-
tion, has a highly competent indigenous 
leadership at both the board and admin-
istrative levels. Since its present educa-
tional program attracts students from 
more than a score of emerging coun-
tries, its promise for future impact can 
hardly be overstated. And Daystar's 
potential for development and Messi-
ah's strengths seem to be highly comple-
mentary." 

The college will assist and monitor the 
new program at Daystar, granting Mes-
siah degrees under the umbrella of its 
own accreditation. It will, in coopera-
tion with Daystar, set the standards for 
admission, curriculum, faculty recruit-
ment and graduation. Plans are for the 

Church News . . . 
married to Anna Coldren Swartz who survives. 
Also surviving are three sons: Earl, Paul and 
Donald; two daughters: Mae Crum and Jean 
Booker; a brother; three sisters; a half-sister; 18 
grandchildren; and seven great-grandchildren. He 
was preceded in death by a daughter, Connie. He 
was a member of the Cedar Grove Brethren in 
Christ Church. Rev. M. Eugene Heidler and Rev. 
Wilbur Benner conducted the funeral service. 
Interment was in the Hillside Cemetery, McAlis-
terville, Pa. 

free exchange of students and faculty 
between the campuses. 

Dr. Hostetter noted the benefits of the 
new development. "Beyond any doubt, 
Messiah College—Africa will help fulfill 
the important objective of expanding 
the international education dimension 
of our college, causing both students 
and faculty to think more globally. But 
two other benefits will accrue—it will 
help meet international educational 
needs, particularly in underdeveloped 
countries, and it will assist the Christian 
church in ministering to a changing 
world." 

Niagara 
Christian 
College News 

A Niagara Christian College alum-
nus, Dr. John Climenhaga, has been 
honoured by having the University of 
Victoria Observatory renamed the Cli-
menhaga Observatory. The occasion of 
the surprise announcement by Univer-
sity of Victoria President, Dr. Howard 
Petch, was a dinner held in honour of 
Dr. Climenhaga's retirement from the 
University of Victoria, where he has 
taught for 33 years. 

The son of Rueben and Elizabeth 
Climenhaga, Dr. Climenhaga has his 
roots in Delisle, Saskatchewan, where 
his father was the pastor of the Delisle 
Brethren in Christ Church. Graduating 
from NCC in 1940, he received his 
Ph.D. in Astronomy from the Univer-
sity of Michigan in 1960. He started 
teaching at Victoria College in 1949 
when he and another colleague taught 
all the physics courses. From 1958 to 
1969 he was head of the Physics Depart-
ment during which time the Elliott 
Building with rooftop Observatory was 
built, and physics plus astronomy pro-
grams grew to involve 22 professors. 
The Board of Governors approved the 
renaming of the landmark dome in 
recognition of the key role played by 
astrophysicist Climenhaga in establish-
ing astronomy as an area of teaching 
and research at the University of 
Victoria. 

On Sunday afternoon, December 12, 
Rev. J. Daniel Houck was ordained to 
the Christian ministry. The service was 
held in the Shenks Brethren in Christ 
Church where Rev. Houck has pastored 
since August. Bishop John A. Byers was 
in charge of the service. The message 
was delivered by Dr. George Vanderlip, 
professor at Eastern Baptist Seminary 
and Dr. Owen Alderfergave the charge. 
Also participating were Fred Geib, Jay 
R. Booser, Omer King, Dick F. Christ-
ma and John A. Brubaker. 

Dan and his wife Sharon are the par-
ents of two sons. He graduated cum 
laude from United Wesleyan College in 
1978 and from Eastern Baptist Semi-
nary in 1982. 

New Field Representative 
Gail Purcell, Springfield, Pa., has 

joined the staff of the Publication Board 
as a field representative for its various 
divisions—Christian Light Bookstores, 
Evangel Press, and the editorial depart-
ment (including the Visitor). 

A Messiah College graduate with a 
Christian education major, Gail will be 
available to share in a variety of work-
shops. In addition, she will be contact-
ing congregational leaders to discover 
how the ministries of the Publication 
Board can better serve the church, as 
well as introducing materials produced 
by the board. 

Gail's office is at the Christian Light 
Bookstore in Elizabethtown, Pa., phone 
(717) 367-1360. 
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It is not a question of how much 
the church needs, but how much 
the members need to give in order 
to fulfill their call to ministry... 

OOPER&nVE 

History 
A little over two hundred years ago a 

small group of Christians joined together 
to baptize each other and begin a move-
ment known as the River Brethren. Now 
known as the Brethren in Christ, this 
religious movement practiced in that 
early baptismal service a cooperation 
which continues to be a mark of the 
group of this day. 

This effort to cooperate in giving 
expression to the Christian faith relied 
much on family models for direction. 
Known as Brethren, they were a part of 
the family of God. The small numbers 
and kinship ties between families made 
it easy to understand the concepts of 
interdependence and cooperation. Some 
of the early outreach ministries accentu-
ated the interdependence between those 
who went and those who stayed. 

This closely knit structure began to 
change as the church caught a new 
vision of certain outreach possibilities. 
Nearly a hundred years ago, church 
buildings became one way in which local 
congregations started to expand their 
ministries. About this time, Sunday 
schools were established, as was a de-
nominational paper which linked the 
increasingly scattered group. From the 
founding community in Lancaster Coun-
ty, Pennsylvania, the group spread 
north to Canada, west to California, 
and many points in between. The oppor-
tunity and challenge to present the Gos-
pel overseas was accepted and schools 
were started to train leadership. 

David McBeth is the Director of Steward-
ship and Finance, U.S.A. He and his wife 
Lois live in Grantham, Pa. 

This reaching out and starting new 
ministries required vision and commit-
ment. It also necessitated support and 
consensus, requiring much cooperation. 
By the middle years of this century, 
greater sophistication was needed to 
operate a growing church. In addition to 
continuing to rely on volunteer leader-
ship for churches and other ministries, 
more professionally trained people were 
installed into key leadership roles. Pro-
grams, including those for financial sup-
port, have been refined to serve the 
needs of a generation more oriented to 
special and technical concerns. 

With all of this specialization, how-
ever, the practice of cooperation has not 
been lost. Budgets continue to be review-
ed and approved by congregations, re-
gional conferences and the General Con-
ference. The various ministries support 
different stages of the life cycle. That is, 
a camper at Kenbrook Bible Camp or 
Mile High Pines Camp may soon be a 
student at Niagara Christian College or 
Messiah College and later a seminary 
student scholarship recipient at Asbury, 
a pastor in Oklahoma or a missionary in 
Japan. Pension funds or care at Messiah 
Village may later be available for retire-
ment years. 

For a number of years the Canadian 
Conference has been working with a 
model of cooperative financial support 
known as Cooperative Ministries. 
Through this joint effort, ministries have 
been helped more than ever and the 
Conference has grown. In the United 
States, projects such as Roxbury Holi-
ness Camp have regularly received co-
operative support from the people of 
both Allegheny and Atlantic Confer-
ences. 

Across the church, plans are being made to implement Cooperative Ministries and 
Mission, the new funding method approved in first reading at Conference last year. 
This article reviews what led up to Cooperative Ministries and Mission; a sequel 
next issue will describe how the funding plan is expected to work. 
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Scriptural foundations 
These actions of the past have had 

their origins in admonitions and exam-
ples found in the Bible. They begin with 
a view that one's faith should affect all of 
life, including resources and relation-
ships. The Manual of Doctrine and 
Government states that "stewardship 
becomes the Christian interpretation of 
life itself and is concerned with the 
Christian's use of all the resources com-
mitted to him, of possessions and per-
sonality." Tithes and offerings are seen 
as the method for gathering support in 
the congregation. This should be done 
on a weekly basis (I Corinthians 16:2). 
When done cheerfully as unto the Lord, 
it does not become legalistic or burden-
some. 

Jesus talks about Christians as those 
who give or lose themselves in order to 
find themselves and have a meaningful 
life (Matthew 10:39). The same principle 
speaks to Christians who are coopera-
tively working together in the context of 
a local church. Their fellowship will be 
stronger when they give to needs locally 
and beyond themselves. The church is a 
giver of resources, be it money, people 
or talent, and not a conservator. This 
will build strength and a vision of God's 
will for his people. 

Several key passages of Scripture deal 
with the gifts of the people of the church 
and liken them to the human body. Just 
as one part of the body does not have all 
the characteristics needed for life, so one 
individual or one church does not have 
all the abilities to fulfill Christian minis-
try. Interdependence within the congre-
gation or denomination is needed in 
order to complete the task. Those strong 
in one area need the freedom and sup-
port to carry out their particular func-
tion while others serve in other capaci-
ties. Competition is then minimized and 
supportiveness is encouraged. 

Evangelical Visitor 
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When the congregation develops a 
strong sense of community it can take 
on the many characteristics of an indi-
vidual person. The church can be ambi-
tious in growth and development, for 
the resources received will be that much 
more numerous for distribution to those 
who need it most. Just as individuals can 
commit in faith and give cheerfully, so 
groups of individuals (churches) can 
also carry out the admonition of I 
Corinthians 16:2 to give systematically 
to those needs beyond their local congre-
gations. 

A challenge to growth 
For some years, the leadership of the 

Brethren in Christ Church has been 
troubled about a relatively modest rate 
of growth. A church group which has 
been in existence for more than two 
hundred years ought to have more 
adherents than can be presently counted. 
This is especially true if it is sincerely 
believed that the way of life we practice 
is thought to be the ideal scriptural 
interpretation. 

A major expression of this concern 
came from a special Consultation on 
Church Growth for church leadership 
which was held prior to the 1976 Gen-
eral Conference. At that time, it was 
affirmed that "we believe it is God's 
design that churches should experience 
growth, both in terms of spiritual depth 
and in numerical increase." Also, at that 
time, a number of suggestions were 
offered which would encourage the 
church to move toward a more rapid 
growth in the years ahead. 
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One of the very specific goals to come 
from the consultation was the one to 
"Double in a Decade." While not quite 
that rapid, the growth already expe-
rienced has highlighted areas needing 
attention if continued growth is to take 
place. In fact, maybe the reason our 
expectations have not been met is that 
there was not adequate planning and 
preparation. For God to entrust our 
church with this great an influx of new 
converts requires that we be able to 
incorporate and nurture them. The old 
ways did not include methods to cope 
with such growth. Perhaps we need bet-
ter and more sophisticated ways of 
operation, not the least of which is better 
planning and coordination of the finan-
cial resources entrusted to us. 

A second Church Growth Consulta-
tion held the summer of 1982 affirmed 
the call for a joint (or cooperative) effort 
which unites all of our congregations 
and agencies. Cooperative Ministries 
and Mission is one of those unifying 
movements which can help the Brethren 
in Christ move to a new level of outreach 
ministry. 

Some specific problems 
In looking at the church structures 

needed for the new growth and outreach 
of the future, the leadership of the 
Brethren in Christ Church has also been 
working on the financial support prob-
lems which have increasingly been iden-
tified. In recent years, some brother-
hood budgets have been adequately 
funded, while others have been woefully 
underfunded. At the same time, there 
has been a severe cash flow problem, 
since some individuals and churches 
have delayed support until near the end 
of the fiscal year, attempting to use the 
cash balance as a means to earn extra 
interest income. In the meantime, thou-
sands of dollars are borrowed at short 
term, high interest rates in order to fund 
the operation of the several ministries. 

This shortfall spawns several other 
problems. Competition for the charita-
ble dollar increases between the various 
brotherhood ministries as each works to 
maintain cash flow. This competition is 
in addition to that generated by minis-
tries of other religious groups. With the 
increase in appeals, some are beginning 
to turn a deaf ear to all, and church 
ministries are the losers. At the same 
time, other donors may make a giving 
decision based upon the emotional im-
pact of the appeal and overlook a more 
significant responsibility which should 
have been cared for by generous sup-
port. This has led some ministry groups 
to use an assessment approach which 
removes the joy from giving. 

Since we are not the small, intimate 
church family that we once were, it is not 
as easy to know what the most urgent 
needs are of the church. With limited 
knowledge, some have not known ade-
quately about the opportunity to sup-
port the more distant needs which are of 
high priority. Others have generously 
supported some ministries at the expense 
of other less visible, but equally worthy 
causes. Decisions on giving have been 
done more at the time of spending, 
rather than at the time of planning, 
budgeting and waiting before the Lord 
for his direction. Faith has had to be 
exercised by ministry leaders, but very 
little by those who support. 

Past approaches have made it rel-
atively unimportant to think in terms of 
giving potential in comparison to actual 
support. They have encouraged the use 
of pressure and provided little oppor-
tunity for responsible giving patterns to 
grow. Moreover, rather than delegating 
decision-making on recommendations 
to those who are more knowledgeable, 
limited personal evaluations and deci-
sions have been accepted as the norm. 

continued on next page 
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When these patterns develop, it then 

becomes easier to consider supporting 
causes which are not our first priority as 
church members. Some donors provide 
a comparable level of trust to church 
ministries as to non-church groups, 
which in some cases may be very ineffec-
tive and untrustworthy. These groups 
may seem more current in their approach-
es or may appear to be more effective, 
but in the final analysis may be only as 
stable as the strength of the current 
leadership. 

Something better than these approach-
es needs to be used in order to anticipate 
the ministry opportunities uniquely avail-
able to the Brethren in Christ. 

A cooperative approach 
The 1982 General Conference of the 

Brethren in Christ Church adopted a 
plan of financial support which is to be 
known as Cooperative Ministries and 
Mission. Cooperation is a central ele-

ment of this plan to support the mission 
of the church through its numerous min-
istries, whether they be sponsored by the 
local congregation, regional conferences 
or the General Conference. 

This plan is an effort to encourage the 
church, including individual members, 
to see the ministry opportunities as a 
whole and not just focus on some of the 
parts. Leadership people are encour-
aged to set priorities based upon public 
presentations of the opportunities as 
seen by the various ministry groups. As 
leaders hear each other and responsible 
groups evaluate the priorities, recom-
mendations for support will be more 
representative, and will more accurately 
match the capabilities of the talents and 
resources of the church, be it a local 
congregation, a regional conference or 
the General Conference. 

This approach can help to fund the 
future growth of the church. The dem-
onstration of strong, mutual support 
can increase the unity of the brother-

hood, even though there is marked 
growth and wide geographical or cultur-
al distribution. Rather than each minis-
try promoting only its work, specific 
needs will be shared in connection with 
the total ministry of the church. This will 
put into practice what we believe about 
the church being a supportive com-
munity. 

Cooperative Ministries and Mission 
will encourage members to give regu-
larly by way of the local church, for each 
local church can participate in a wider 
range of ministries in this approach. 
Such regular giving to the biblical "store-
house" will help to assure regular cash 
flow. The goals which are projected will 
be based upon the opportunities availa-
ble for ministry, the financial potential 
of the group and the amount of vision 
known to be present. Assessment or 
taxation will not be a part of this, as past 
giving practices and the direction of the 
Holy Spirit will also be considered when 
goals are suggested. This should help to 
make cheerful givers! 

Since we are not the 
small, intimate church 
family that we once were, 
it is not as easy to know 
the most urgent needs ot 
the church. 

While the emphasis of this approach 
is cooperative, there is also provision for 
direct giving by a donor to a specific 
ministry. This allows for the expression 
of a special calling or concern. Specific 
guidelines for using this approach will 
be available to the donor and the receiv-
ing ministry. 

In establishing Cooperative Ministries 
and Mission, it is hoped that more 
resources will be able to be available to 
fund church ministries. Some of the 
energy now expended competitively can 
be rechanneled to expand the total sup-
port, for a rising tide can lift everyone. It 
is not a question of how much the 
church needs, but how much the mem-
bers need to give in order to fulfill their 
call to ministry through the church. This 
becomes brotherhood giving at its 
best—each one gives proportionally to 
causes which knowledgeable people 
have evaluated and promoted in order 
to meet ministry opportunities uniquely 
available to the Brethren in Christ. 

Evangelical Visitor 
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The fact that more people have been killed 
in automobile accidents than in all the nation s wars 
is a truth that should shock all people. 

The combination of defensive driving methods 
and a commitment to the Christian belief in 
the sanctity of human life 
should go far toward changing 
how we think about driving 
and our driving behavior. 



the contemporary scene 
"Priceless" page from rare 
Bible found in England 
LONDON (EP)—A British scholar has dis-
covered a priceless page from an eighth-
century English Bible wrapped around land 
records in a house in Dorset, the Guardian 
newspaper reported recently. 

John Fuggles, library adviser for Britain's 
National Trust historic and conservation 
society, was going through real estate docu-
ments in a room at the house—recently 
acquired by the trust—when he found the 
page from the Ceolfrid Bible, the paper said. 
Dating from the year 713, the Ceolfrid Bible 
is considered one of the rarest and most 
ancient documents in the English language. 

A few pages from the Bible, originally 
intended as a gift for the Pope, have survived 
and are a treasured exhibit at the British 
Library in London. 

Soviet troops in Afghanistan 
turning to religion? 
NAIROBI, Kenya (EP)—Letters and other 
personal papers found by Afghan guerillas, 
the Mujahidin, on the bodies of Soviet sol-
diers killed in Afghanistan show that a signi-
ficant minority of these young men were 
Christians or Muslims, according to a spe-
cial article in the Kenya Standard, reported 
by East/West News Service. 

The recently acquired letters (all taken out 
of the country by Afghan refugees) include 
one written by Private Peter Ivanovich Dik. 
In it he warmly greets his two sisters, "with 
the love of our Lord Jesus Christ." He 
implored them not to forget to ask their 
parents to send him a New Testament. Dik, a 
22-year-old bachelor from Tokskow village 
in Orenburg district and a driver in civilian 
life, reported that he was "living a dog's life" 
in Afghanistan. He said he had just spent 
three days "lying under our vehicles and 
sleeping." "Maybe," he added, "they will 
move us tomorrow." 

The authorities' atheist indoctrination of 
members of the Soviet armed forces, even 
more intense than that of the U.S.S.R.'s civ-
ilian population, is often maladroit. This was 
acknowledged in a recent Volga Radio dis-
cussion program The broadcasters, p.ll offi-
cial spokesmen, admitted the existence of 
religious people in the Soviet armed forces 
and discussed the "problems" associated 
with "re-educating" them. In a recent issue of 
Krasnaya Zvezda, the Defense Ministry 
daily newspaper, a Colonel N. Kusher deplor-
ed the state of "atheist education" in the 
armed forces. "There are still many com-
manders and political workers who give too 
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little attention to this important area of edu-
cational work," he said. Another issue of this 
Moscow newspaper expressed outrage over 
an army officer, a member of the Commu-
nist Party, having married in a church. 

The state publishing houses in the 
U. S. S. R. have greatly increased their output 
of anti-religious books and pamphlets since 
early in 1980, only a few months after the 
start of the Soviet military intervention in 
Afghanistan in December 1979. A recent 
article in Qazadstan Komunisii (the Kazakh-
stan Communist) appealed to all "honest 
citizens" to conduct a "merciless struggle 
against religion, which poisons minds." 

Islands linked by 
spiritual force 
NASSAU, Bahamas (EP)—Twenty-five 
thousand Bahamians crowded into Nassau's 
15,000-seat T. A. Robinson Sports Stadium 
for a one-day Billy Graham Rally on Novem-
ber 24. It was the largest religious gathering 
ever held in the Islands. The crowd at that 
midweek evangelistic meeting was over one-
tenth of the 230,000 population of the 
Bahamas. When the Pope visited here, 
15,000 heard him. Over 2,200 people respond-
ed to the evangelistic invitation at the con-
clusion of the rally. Fifty percent of those 
were indicating first-time decisions for 
Christ. 

"This crusade will have a lasting impact on 
the Islands from a spiritual, social and moral 
perspective," said the Right Reverend Wil-
liam M. Johnson of the Church of God of 
the Bahamas. "It is something even the 
Christian community did not expect." 

Church leaders commented on the unpre-
cedented cooperation. "We are 700 islands 
and have not been used to cooperating," said 
the Rev. Charles A. Sweeting, president of 
Queen's College, a Methodist training 
school. "Billy Graham has been a focus for 
the church. I believe that this is the start of 
something that is going to carry on." 

Archaeologists may have made 
historic find in Capernaum 
NEW YORK (EP)—Archaeologists may 
have discovered the house where Jesus stay-
ed in Capernaum, according to an article 
published in the November/ December issue 
of the Biblical Archaeology Review. In the 
topmost level of the site, the Franciscan 
Fathers who conducted the excavation 
found an octagon-shaped church. In antiq-
uity, octagonal churches were built over sites 

that memorialized places of special impor-
tance to the early church. 

The octagonal church in Capernaum proba-
bly marked the site of St. Peter's house, say 
James F. Strange and Hershel Shanks, 
authors of the article. Strange is a Biblical 
archaeologist and expert in early Christian-
ity who teaches at the University of South 
Florida. Shanks is editor of the Biblical 
Archaeology Review, the journal of the Bib-
lical Archaeology Society. According to 
implications in the Gospels of Matthew and 
Mark, Jesus lived in St. Peter's house in 
Capernaum. If this is in fact St. Peter's 
house, this is where Jesus stayed. Here he 
also cured the paralytic who was lowered 
through the roof (Mark 2). 

Beneath the octagonal church, archaeolo-
gists found a house that had been converted 
into a church in the mid-first century A.D. 
The house was originally built in the first 
century B.C. Christian pilgrims by the thou-
sands came to the house-church and scratch-
ed their messages and signs in the plaster 
walls of the now-venerated room. Over 100 
of these graffiti, as they are called, have sur-
vived. These include a number of crosses and 
messages like "Christ have mercy" and "Lord 
Jesus Christ help thy servant." The Francis-
can Fathers believe they can read the name 
of Peter in two of the graffiti, but Strange 
and Shanks are skeptical; they cannot see 
these letters in the almost illegible scratch-
ings. 

Nevertheless, they argue that the first-
century house may have originally belonged 
to St. Peter and was then turned into a 
house-church when the walls were first plas-
tered in the late first-century A.D. Then in 
the fifth century, the octagonal church was 
built precisely over this venerated room. St. 
Peter's house is just 84 feet south of Caper-
naum's famous ancient synagogue. 

And finally. . . 
GARDEN GROVE, Calif, is talking about 
the $1 million Christmas pageant at the 
Crystal Cathedral. The Glory of Christmas— 
A Living Nativity, ran in mid-December 
nightly with live camels, donkeys, sheep and 
a ram, a 90-foot tall backdrop with six 
separate screens, a sky with more than 1,000 
stars, a cast of nearly 400, a shepherd boy, 
the largest pipe organ in the USA and four 
"flying angels." "Never before in the history 
of Christianity in the United States has 
anyone retold the story of the birth of Christ 
in the scope presented in the Crystal Cathe-
dral," says Dr. Robert H. Schuller, the 
cathedral's senior pastor and TV preacher. 
Admission ran $10.50 and $12.50. 
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Job well begun 
First let me say that we thoroughly 

enjoy reading the Visitor. The articles 
are interesting and informative and of 
just the right length. 

I am not writing this letter in protest 
against or rebuttal to any issue, but 
rather in praise of an institution that 
does not receive much praise. 

In November, we made ourselves 
available to spend two weeks at the Pax-
ton St. Home in Harrisburg doing what-
ever kind of work there was to be done. 
When we arrived on a Sunday evening, 
we were welcomed into a loving, caring, 
homey atmosphere and immediately felt 
a part of the family. As the days passed 
we found plenty of work to be done— 
that is a big place and just the everyday 
upkeep is a big job. The people who 
have given so much time there in reno-
vating the building have done a tre-
mendous job, but there is always some-
thing that needs fixing. 

The one thing that impressed us most 
was the way the staff give of themselves 
to make Paxton Street a real home for 
the residents. The physical, social and 
spiritual welfare of the residents get 
equal attention. Many times during the 
day a staff member is called upon to 
minister in a personal way. There are 
Bible study groups that meet regularly 
and each evening devotions are held for 
those who care to participate. The food 
is outstanding—tastily prepared and at-
tractively served. 

We truly considered it a privilege to 
be a part of such a dedicated program of 
providing a home for those people, 
many of whom have no one else to care. 
It is a job well begun and merits the 
support of all of us. 

Wilma B. Frey 
Abilene, KS 

Adding a word 
Naturally I can't object if someone 

tells of his own life and contributions 
with humility—that's what I would have 
expected of Lewis Sider (whose testi-
mony appeared on the back cover of the 
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December 10 Visitor). But let me add a 
word. 

Like us all, he affirms that life is "no 
bed of roses," and his was "filled with 
many mistakes and failures." However, 
Lewis Sider's life was not only that. I 
found him to be a friend and source of 
good advice when I was a young, fresh 
(in many ways!) missionary. People here 
in Zimbabwe still ask about him and 
remember him with love and apprecia-
tion. He worked hard, did much, did it 
well, and didn't complain. 

Perhaps the best thing I can remember 
is that when Lewis talked, he always had 
something to say—a rare quality! 

Fred Holland 
Bulawayo, Zimbabwe 

Permit me to respond to Lewis Sider's 
"Reflections of a 'retired' missionary" 
(Dec. 10). Do I detect a faint tinge of 
need for him to reassess the values to be 
gained from life's inevitable struggles, a 
reaffirmation of the gain from a life 
spent in service to spiritual needs with-
out the usual assurance of adequate 
material security? I suspect he represents 
something of a multitude of people who 
experience an occasional uncertain 
thought. Even the patient and virtuous 
Job cried out at one point, "If a man die, 
shall he live again?" Doubt is part of the 
legacy of human finiteness. 

But it isn't the big, the famous, or the 
glamorous that represent values, or not 
many would find place in the world of 
worth. Sometimes it goes back to little 
things. Lewis and I, as well as some 
others, went to college together in the 
latter 1930's at Beulah College. I remem-
ber his struggle with a speech problem 
while I gained some notice as a speaker. 
But he got the A in History while I got 
the C. I recall how at one of those Young 
Adult Forum sessions we used to have 
at the Upland Church, Lewis outlined 
the variant religious beliefs of the most 
renowned of our country's founding 
fathers. It was a little jarring to some of 
us who always thought of our country as 
founded on our brand of Christianity. 

Lewis may not have had a "silver 
tongue," but he delivered the message. 
And isn't that what mission work is all 
about? 

Like the rest of us, he worked for 
what he got. He was just as black as the 
rest of us when he came in from smudg-
ing orange groves on those cold morn-
ings. Part of our education in those days 
was earning the money to pay for it. 

Is this trivia that I am writing? Maybe 
so. But the detail of Lewis Sider's life 
isn't. As it isn't for anyone who struggles 
to be a worthy part of God's Kingdom. 
How many more stories could be told 
about the efforts of others? The appreci-
ation we have and express for the life of 
others is an integral part of the founda-
tion of the Christian faith. 

Millard Herr 
Upland, CA 

Thanks for the airmail 
While we were in Nairobi, we really 

appreciated the airmail service for the 
Evangelical Visitor. 

We got the Gospel Herald, for exam-
ple, by surface mail, and it would be 
three to four months before we got it. 
One day we received four Gospel 
Heralds. Interesting! 

Paul W. Nisly 
Messiah College 
Grantham, PA 

The Visitor is sent by airmail to per-
sons assigned by Brethren in Christ Mis-
sions, to church members serving under 
other missions organizations, and to 
selected leaders in overseas Brethren in 
Christ fellowships. This is made possible 
by the generous support of relatives of 
mission workers and others interested in 
this practical expression of brotherhood. 

If you would like to join in bringing 
the Visitor "on time" to persons we've 
sent overseas, send your gifts to "Air-
mail Fund," P.O. Box 166, Nappanee, 
IN 46550. 
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editorial 

A "front line" ministry 
It was near the end of a church growth confer-

ence when one of the participants commented that 
"church planting pastors really are the ones in the 
front line of the ministry." 

That phrase really struck me, and I jotted on the 
margin of my tablet: "Who really is on the 'front 
lines'?" A pastor of a small, struggling mountain 
congregation came to mind—faithfully ministering 
to the needs of the church and community families 
but not seeing a great surge of growth in his church. 
That pastor is not "in the front line"? 

Then a few days later, I heard a person, cham-
pioning the need for increased support for overseas 
mission personnel, assert that "they are the ones 
who are out there, on the front lines, spreading the 
gospel." And I had to think of some home mission 
workers who have spent decades in dedicated 
service—don't they qualify for such honor? 

Both speakers had very good intentions, I am 
sure. And perhaps they had similar ideas in mind 
when they referred to these two groups of church 
workers. Both the missionary and the church plant-
er have been given the apostolic commission of 
establishing the church in areas where there is no 
church. Called by God, they are thrust into new and 
different communities and cultures, and often must 
learn a different language. Removed f rom family, 
friends and the supportive Christian community to 
which they have been accustomed, these servants of 
the church have to seek out or create new sources of 
fellowship, emotional support and spiritual encour-
agement. 

Let me pause to note that as members of the 
sending church, we must be sensitive to the unique 
needs of the brothers and sisters we have commis-
sioned for such assignments. They are deserving of 
our continued prayer and our careful, liberal sup-
port. While our fellowship has done well in this 
regard, there is still much room for improvement. 

However, we dare not think of these essential 
ministries as being exclusively "where the real 
action is." We know, of course, that the value of our 

service to the Lord is not measured by the miles we 
have traveled away from home. Certainly our per-
sonal ministry is not validated by the degree of 
visibility we have attained within the church. But 
every now and then, we seem to act as if this were so. 

In I Corinthians 12—a beautifully practical 
exposition of the essential nature of the church— 
the Apostle Paul likens the community of believers 
to the human body. Just as there are different limbs 
and organs in the body, so there are different func-
tions and spiritual gifts in the church. These differ-
ing gifts and ministries, Paul says, are present 
"because God has arranged the parts in the body, 
every one of them, just as he wanted them to be" (v. 
18). Some of these (could he have said apostles, 
pastors and teachers?) have more visibility than 
others, but each one has value, regardless of visibil-
ity, since each works together for the healthy func-
tioning of the whole body. In fact, f rom God's 
perspective, honor is given to those members whose 
ministry might otherwise go unnoticed. 

We do well to voice appreciation for those who 
serve the church in positions of leadership and min-
istry, both in the larger church and in the congrega-
tion. But there is very little profit to be realized in 
debating who among us really in "in the front line." 
In fact, there is the danger that the rest of us may be 
tempted to sit back, relax, and assume our task to 
be that of the cheering section. Such "spectator 
Christianity" is totally foreign to the spirit of the 
New Testament. 

"Now you are the body of Christ," Paul asserts, 
"and each one of you is a part of it." God offers a 
"front line ministry" to each of us—whether we be a 
teacher in the classroom, an office worker or ma-
chinist on the job, or a neighbor having 9ea with a 
friend. We need not cross cultural or language bar-
riers to find people in need of a listening ear, a 
healing touch, a restoring embrace. Sharing the 
good news of love, forgiveness and wholeness 
through Christ is the calling of every believer, with 
the Holy Spirit giving us differing arenas in which 
to minister. 

Who really is "in the front line" in sharing the 
Gospel? It should be each one of us. G 

J 
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The names have been changed in this true story, which has its setting in southern California. 

B etty Harris. I recognized the name 
instantly, but remained silent. After all, 
I was a new member of the visitation 
program at my church and had joined to 
learn how to share my faith in Christ 
more effectively—with anyone whose 
name we were given. 

Could be someone else with the same 
name, I thought as we drove across 
town that particular night. To be hon-
est, I hoped it was. Not that I had any-
thing against Betty personally, of course, 
but she was such an odd person. 

I hadn't seen her for several months, 
but would never forget the first time she 
visited choir practice one Thursday eve-
ning. Since our choir is large, it's easy for 
a newcomer to get lost in the crowd; I 
determined to welcome this new person 
and make her feel at home. 

"Hi, I'm Kitty Reese," I began with a 
big smile. 

She just looked at me for a moment. 
"Hello," she said finally, cautiously, not 
even a slight smile on that sober face. It 
was more than just sober, though. The 
look was suspicious, almost guarded. 

"What's your name?' I asked, still 
smiling. 

"Betty Harris," she replied so softly I 
barely heard it. "Excuse me, I'd better 
find a seat." 

Being human, I was annoyed by her 
indifferent attitude, but refused to let it 
show. In fact, I said hello to Betty every 
time I saw her after that. The most I got 
in return was a nod. Suddenly she 
dropped out of choir, and I soon forgot 
about Betty Harris. We had a commit-
tee which checked up on absentee mem-
bers, and I was not on that committee. 
Perhaps I should have made an effort to 
contact Betty myself, but to be honest I 
didn't even think about it. We hadn't 
become friends, after all, and I didn't 
have her address or phone number. 

"Betty Harris," my visitation partner 
and trainer repeated as she parked the 
car. "I'll expect you to take part in the 
initial conversation, Kitty, and perhaps 
share your testimony as well." 

"Okay," I agreed halfheartedly. I had 
been singing solos for years, but this 
witnessing business was something brand 
new, and much more difficult. At the 
same time, Jody Cutler, my trainer, had 
been very patient, helping me master the 
gospel outline one step at a time. Watch-
ing her witness for the Lord was a tre-
mendous inspiration. 

Betty Harris—the same Betty Harris I 
had known in choir—opened the door. 
"Yes?" she began. Then our eyes met 
and it was obvious that she remembered 

Oh, you're from the church." 
"Yes, we wanted to return your 

visit," Jody replied brightly. 
"I'm Jody Cutler and this 

is Kitty—" 

"We know each other," I interrupted. 
"Betty sang in the choir a while back." 

"How nice!" Jody exclaimed. "May 
we come in, Betty?" 

"All right," Betty agreed, not overly 
enthusiastic. 

We went through the usual proce-
dure, complimenting her apartment— 
which really was beautifully decorat-
ed— and talking about general subjects. 
She would answer direct questions, but 
volunteered nothing. I watched Betty as 
Jody carefully directed the conversation 
toward spiritual matters. There was still 
that guarded, suspicious look in Betty's 
eyes, as if she didn't quite trust us. 

J ody was skilled in witnessing and 
moved right into the gospel presentation 
after I gave a brief testimony. This is a 
waste of time, I thought, even though it 
was quite apparent that Betty Harris 
was trusting in her own good works and 
accomplishments. Oh, she believed in 
God, but was clearly not trusting Christ 
alone for her salvation. 

If it had been me, I would have 
stopped long before Jody did. Betty lis-
tened quietly, but was not really absorb-
ing. The dull expression on her face told 
me that much. 

"Would you like to receive the gift of 
eternal life which Christ offers you 
tonight?" Jody asked finally. 

"No, I just couldn't do that right 
now," Betty answered, glancing at her 
watch. 

continued on page 23 

Waste of time 
A true story as told to Angela Keith Benedict 

32 Evangelical Visitor 


	Evangelical Visitor - February, 1983 Vol. 96. No. 2.
	Recommended Citation

	tmp.1602006147.pdf.zusQj

